
alwaysfitathletic.com 
603-747-8006 

Woodsville, NH

TAKE ADVANTAGE OF OUR  
3 MONTH SUMMER SPECIAL!  

Start your ADULT membership anytime before July 1st  
and lock-in for $45/month for 3 months!

ZUMBA IS BACK! 
Mondays at 5:15 pm

• Life Insurance
• Disability Insurance
• Retirement Planning

• Long Term Care
• College Planning

Main St. N., Wells River, VT
802-588-5035 

nate@nmafinancial.com
www.nmafinancial.com

The simplicity & affordability 
may surprise you!

• FREE Home consultations
    • System Design    • 1-3 day install

NO money out of pocket 
cost to own your own power.

1-802-222-3244       www.Gosolarnh.net

Pool & SPa SuPPlieS

SaleS & Service
260 Meadow St., Littleton, NH  

603-444-5454
WWW.COUNTRYPOOLS.COM

Largest Selection of
PARTS & ACCESORIES

for All RV’s!

5th Wheels, 
Travel Trailers, 

Campers 

603-638-2200
www.chdanarv.com
628 Woodsville rd., Monroe, NH

CCHH   DDaannaa  RRVV
sales & service

FREE GIFT WITH 
PURCHASE

Upcycled Home Goods, 
Antiques, Craft, DIY & Salvage 

Supplies. Baskets, Windows, 
Picture Frames, Shutters,

Vintage Cans, etc. 

The Rusty Bucket 
37 Depot St. Lyndonville, Vt.
802/745-8695 therustybucket.net

VILLAGE ECLECTICS
Come See Our Line of

Leather Products in store
til the end of June!

802-449-3330     Bradford, VT 
M-F 10:00-5:30 Sat 10:00-5:00
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	 LOON MOUNTAIN, NH 
Tickets to the New England 
Brewfest, one of the most 
popular annual beer festi-
vals, taking place Friday, 
June 23-Sunday, June 25, 
are on sale on the event’s of-
ficial website www.newbrew-

fest.com. Located at the foot 
of scenic Loon Mountain, the 
New England Brewfest fea-
tures three days of a unique 
blend of beer-infused social 
events, educational work-
shops and its signature Sat-
urday Night: ON TAP tasting 

event.  
 	 W e s t e r n 
White Moun-
tains Chamber 
of Commerce, 
which is produc-
ing the event for 
its 13th year, 
also released 
a preliminary 
list of 30 par-
ticipating brew-
eries: Angry 
Orchard Hard 
Cider, Brook-
lyn Brewery, 
Hidden Moon 
Brewing, Mag-
ic Hat Brewing 
Company, Nau-
ti Seltzer, One 
Love Brewery, 
Samuel Adams, 
Sebago Brew-
ing Company, 

Shipyard, Smuttynose Brew-
ing Company, Switchback 
Brewing Company, Traveler 
Beer Company, Wachusett 
Brewing Company, Wood-
chuck Cider, Bolton Beer 
Works, Henniker Brewing, 
Moat Mountain and Bad Lab 
Brewing Company.
 	 Life is Good Kids Founda-
tion (LiGKF) was named the 
event’s official charity part-
ner. The mission of The Life 
is Good Kids Foundation is 
to spread the power of opti-
mism to help kids heal. Vis-
itors to the official New En-
gland Brewfest website will 
have the opportunity to make 
donations of any amount to 
LiGKF.
 	 Beer aficionados, industry 
professionals and travelers 
enjoying a weekend getaway 
in New England will sip and 
savor brand new brews and 
seasonal favorites. Tickets 
are sold separately for each 
of the weekend events:
 

Friday June 23, 2017
	 Cafe Lafayette Craft Beer 
Train ($75)  - 2-hour train ride 

along the Pemigewassett 
River features a selection of 
locally sourced dishes, each 
paired with a craft beer.
	 One Love Brewery 
Beer Pairing Dinner ($65) - 
Beer-centric menu offers a 
series of stationed-pairings.
 

Saturday June 24, 2017
	 ON TAP at the New En-
gland Brewfest ($40)  - In-
cludes admission, event 
t-shirt, official tasting glass, 
all beer samples, live music, 
and on-site parking.  Gener-
al admission begins at 4pm; 
VIP ticket ($60) offers early 
entry at 3 pm.  Event ends at 
8pm, and shuttle bus trans-
portation will be available to 
select lodging properties.
	 New England Brewfest 
Seminars ($45) – A unique 
learning opportunity from 
10am to 1pm.
 

Sunday June 25, 2017
	 Brewers Brunch ($35)  - 
Breakfast buffet at the Moun-
tain Club on Loon at 9:30am, 
with an opportunity to meet 
brewers from around New 

England and learn more 
about them.
	 Believing Brewers ($8 
gondola tickets to moun-
tain-summit service available 
at Loon Mountain Sports by 
requesting  “church ticket”) 
- Hosted by Loon Mountain 
Ministry.
 	 An array of lodging pack-
ages to suit a range of budget 
needs can also be booked 
via the New England Brew-
fest website. Special ticket, 
meal and lodging packages 
are being offered by local 
spa resorts, condominiums, 
lodges and economy-priced 
hotels.
	 For more information, to 
buy tickets, reserve lodg-
ing, or to make a donation to 
LiGKF, please visit www.ne-
brewfest.com. ;  Attendees at 
all Brewfest events must be 
21 years old, ID required.

Beer Festival to Raise Funds for Life is Good Children’s Foundation
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By Gary Scruton

	 I have mentioned in this 
column before that there are 
many ways to define an eat-
ery. There are fancy spots, 
fast spots, every day spots, 
and simply good food spots. 
Due to this column my wife, 
Janice, and I have been able 
to visit, and eat, at many 
of these establishments. 
(Yeah, it’s tough work, but 
somebody’s got to do it). 
	 For this issue we traveled 
into the village of  Bradford 
and one of the long standing 
businesses that has served 
the needs of multiple gen-
erations of local residents 
as well as visitors. From 
the outside the Bliss Vil-
lage Store has the look of 
a long standing part of the 
community. Once 

you step inside and walk 
around the corner to the deli 
you find one of the reasons 
it has been around so long. 
The deli case has plenty of  
slice-able meats and chees-
es, plus there is always a 
nice selection of ready to 
eat meals that you can pur-
chase by the pound or by 
the serving. There is also a 
grill behind the counter and 
a nice menu of items from 
sandwiches to pizza along 
with several varieties of ice 
cream. 
	 The night we headed to 
Bradford we took a friend 
with us, so there were three 
meals all together, and as 
usual we all ordered some-
thing different. Our friend 
Kathy ordered a bacon 
cheeseburger and sweet po-

tato fries. Janice decided on 
a roast beef sandwich and 
an order of regular fries. My 
decision was made easier by 
one of the signs on the front 
of the deli counter. It men-
tioned a special of a lobster 
roll with french fries and cole 
slaw. Once we placed our 
orders we walked over to 
one of the many glass front-
ed coolers in order to pick 
out our drinks for the meal. 
Janice and I grabbed some 
nice iced tea while Kathy 
went with a simple bottle of 
Poland Springs water (she 
ended up getting a second 
bottle before we left).
	 The dining area at the 
Bliss village Store is not 
anything fancy. A couple of 
booths and a couple of ta-
bles sit in a room with a nice 

big window overlooking the 
Bradford Golf Course and 
the White Mountains of New 
Hampshire in the distance. 
Not a bad view at all on a 
nice early June evening.
	 When the meals were 
ready the gentleman be-
hind the deli counter brought 
them all out together to us 
along with forks for all and 
a squeeze bottle of ketch-
up. No fancy wait staff just 
pleasant service. 
	 When the food did arrive 
we, as usual, were not disap-
pointed at all. Kathy ordered 
her burger well done. Her 
comment was something 
like “I don’t want any moo 
left in my burger”. Though 
many places now highly rec-
ommend not ordering well 
done meats Kathy said that 
this burger was cooked all 
the way through but was 
still delicious, not dry, and 
just the way she wanted it. I 
should also mention that the 
burger was served on a Kai-
ser type bun and extended 
beyond the bun on all sides 
with bacon seen all around 
also. The sweet potato fries 
were also a hit for Kathy as 
they were nice and crisp on 

the outside but moist on the 
inside.  They quickly disap-
peared. 
	 Janice’s comments about 
her roast beef sandwich in-
cluded “look at all that meat!”  
The wheat bread, lettuce 
and tomato slices topped 
with a dab of mayo made 
the perfect sandwich and 
the fries on the  side were 
cooked and crispy without 
being dried out. 
	 In regards to my lobster 
roll, it came on a hot dog 
roll that had all it could do 
to hold all of the lobster sal-
ad that was dished into this 
vessel. Along with the roll 
were some more of those 
wonderful fries, and a side of 
cole slaw. The slaw was, as 
is true in many spots, served 
in one of those white paper 
cups. I considered it a good 
tasting side without any of 
those unusual additions that 
can sometime surprise, and 
sometimes disappoint those 
who like it simple. 
	 Over all the three of use 
enjoyed a good meal, a nice 
view, and a price $31.19 that 
can keep anybody coming 
back on a regular basis. 

Bliss Village Store

PEYTON PLACE RESTAURANT
AT THE HISTORIC 1773 MANN TAVERN

Serving Dinner Wednesday - Sunday from 5:30 PM

Concious Food • Chef Owned
Catering • Wine Dinners • Patio  
Jazz Sundays beginning in June

www.PeytonPlaceRestaurant.com
Main St., Orford, NH  603-353-9100

Located Inside 
Wells River Pharmacy
Monday - Saturday 
6:00 am - 2:00 pm

Sunday 7:00 am - Noon

Listen 

to WYKR 

for Daily 

Specials

Monday-
Saturday 
11am-10pm
Sunday 
12pm-9pm

1216 Railroad 
Street
802-424-2EAT
802-424-2328

FREE 
DELIVERY 
within 
10 Miles

Locally 
produced 

King Arthur 
Flour, and 
partnering 
with local 

farms to offer 
locally grown 

meats and 
veggies. 

Formerly
Ramunto’s

FORMERLY
RAMUNTO’S

NOW OPEN
YEAR ROUND. . . . . . . . . . . . . .

Friday - Monday
7 am - 3 pm

Our own
STONE-GROUND
WHOLE GRAIN

pancakes served with
Pure Maple Products!

Made from Scratch

I-93 Exit 38, Route 117
Sugar Hill, NH

(603) 823-5575
www.pollyspancakeparlor.com

9 Central Street, Woodsville 
Candlepin Bowling, Bar & Grill, 

Seasonal Menu
603-243-0393

Karaoke 
Every Thursday

Family Day 
Every Sunday

Wednesday 3-11 PM
Thursday 3 PM - 12 AM

Friday 3 PM - 1 AM
Saturday Noon - 1 AM
Sunday Noon - 10 PMOPEN

NOW

Grill Hours: 6:00 am-10:00 pm

Check Our Daily 
Homemade 

Specials
2886 Route 302

Wells River, VT  05081
(802) 429-2141

(802) 429-2068 Fax
jiffy37@champlainoil.com

Fathers Day 
Breakfast Buffet   

8:00 am - 1:00 pm   

Sunday, June 18

$9.59
Plus Tax
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Trendy Dining Guide Ads 
This size is $129 for eight issues

Or choose 13 issues for $199
Plus get a Trendy Dining Guide Review
For details contact Gary at 603-747-2887

or email Gary@TrendyTimes.com

	 Lincoln, NH – The Win-
nipesaukee Scenic Railroad 
will once again offer those 
wishing to attend activi-
ties during the 94th annual 
Laconia Motorcycle Week 
round-trip train service from 
their Meredith Station lo-
cated at 154 Main Street to 
Weirs Beach and back on 
Saturday & Sunday, June 
10 & 11, 2017, and again on 
Thursday through Sunday, 
June 15, 16, 17 & 18, 2017.
 	 Trains will depart Mere-
dith Station for Weirs Beach 
on Saturday and Sunday, 
June 10th and 11th, every 
hour on the half-hour start-
ing at 10:30am through 
4:30pm with return trips de-
parting from Weirs Beach to 
Meredith every hour on the 
hour from 11:00am through 
5:00pm.
 	 On Thursday, Friday & 
Saturday, June 15, 16 & 17, 
trains will depart Meredith 
Station for Weirs Beach ev-
ery hour on the half-hour 
starting at 10:30am and op-
erating through 9:30pm with 
return trips departing from 
Weirs Beach to Meredith 
every hour on the hour from 
11:00am through 10:00pm.
 	 On Sunday, June 18, 
2017, Trains will depart Mer-
edith Station for Weirs Beach 
every hour on the half-hour 
starting at 10:30am through 
2:30pm with return trips de-
parting from Weirs Beach to 
Meredith every hour on the 
hour from 11:00am through 
3:00pm.
 	 Free parking is available 

at the Meredith Station for 
those wishing to take the 
train to Weirs Beach and 
back during the 94th annual 
Laconia Motorcycle Week. 
Tickets for the round-trip 
train service from Meredith 
to Weirs Beach and back 
are $20.00 per person, while 
ages 2 and under ride for 
free.
 	 Please note that the Win-
nipesaukee Scenic Railroad 
will no longer be offering 
train service from Lakeport, 
NH to Weirs Beach and back 
on Friday and Saturday 
during Laconia Motorcycle 
Week as they have in previ-
ous years.
 	 The Winnipesaukee Sce-
nic Railroad station is conve-
niently located just off Route 
3 at 154 Main Street in Mer-

edith, NH, while the Weirs 
Beach ticket booth is conve-
niently on the Boardwalk at 
211 Lakeside Avenue across 
from the arcades, just off 
Route 3. Trains at the Winni-
pesaukee Scenic Railroads 
operate rain or shine during 
the 94th annual Laconia Mo-
torcycle Week and all excur-
sions are round-trip.
 	 For more information re-
garding train schedules for 
the 94th annual Laconia Mo-
torcycle Week June 10-18, 
2017, visit  www.HoboRR.
com or call 603-745-2135.

Winnipesaukee Scenic Railroad Readies For 
94th Annual Laconia Motorcycle Week

Train service from Meredith, NH to Weirs Beach, NH aboard the 
Winnipesaukee Scenic Railroad and back during Laconia Mo-
torcycle week provides event-goers with an opportunity to avoid 
the traffic congestion along Route 3 and take advantage of free 
parking at the Meredith Station at the same time.

RICHARD THOMPSON, SOLO ACOUSTIC  
WITH SPECIAL GUEST SETH GLIER

Wednesday, June 21 • 8 pm
Tickets: $39, $49, $62

“One of the Top 20 Guitarists of All Time” —Rolling Stone. 
One of the world’s most critically acclaimed songwriters. 

AIMEE MANN 
WITH SPECIAL GUEST JONATHAN COULTON

Saturday July 1 • 8 pm
Tickets: $42, $49, $64

Oscar-nominated, Grammy Award-winning singer/
songwriter known for her quick wit and stinging observation.

Order LIVE! tickets at: 
BethlehemColonial.org

MAIN STREET, BETHLEHEM, NEW HAMPSHIRE
603.869.3422
EVENT LINE:

JOIN US AT THE MOVIES TOO! PRESENTING THE BEST IN INDEPENDENT & WORLD CINEMA
SHOWTIMES: SAT: 5:00 (Open Caption when available) & 7:30; SUN: 2:30 Matinee & 7:30; MON & TUE: 7:30;  

WED: 5:30 Buddy Nite; THURS 7:30. Assisted Listening headphones available for movies.

Delicious Concessions featuring Beer & Wine, fine chocolates, coffee, tea, and more.

	 “It’s not every day the 
North Country sees a brand 
new locally-based musi-
cal ensemble,” says Victo-
ria Cole, Music Director of 
the new community cham-
ber choir, White Mountains 
Camerata.  “This is a project 
I’ve thought about for some 
time, and finally in March, 
I just decided to start.  We 
have quickly grown. It’s very 
exciting.”
	 The Camerata fills a hole 
in the local music scene. 
“The North Country Cho-
rus out of northern Vermont 
has been doing the stan-
dard large-chorus repertoire 
for many years” said Cole.  
“And Pine Hill Singers does 
the women’s chorus stuff.  
But no one is offering the 
mixed-voice chamber-size 
choral repertoire.  We have 
about 20 singers right now. 
I’m hoping for around 28 
total. Eventually, this is the 
size group that would sing 
the cantatas of J.S. Bach, 
for example, or much of 
the repertoire written by the 
great German Romantic 
composers like Brahms and 
Schumann who wrote exten-
sively with this size group in 
mind.”
	 The first public outing for 
this brand-new ensemble 
will be on Thursday, June 22 

at 7:30 pm at All Saints Epis-
copal Church.  The Debut 
Concert is free and open to 
the public.  Pianists Joseph 
Hansalik and Robert Wilson 
are collaborators  
	 “This is more of a mu-
sical soiree– it’s a bit of a 
potpourri then we will usu-
ally do. We have pieces by 
Morley, Brahms, and Charlie 
Chaplin all in the mix.  At the 
beginning of every artistic 
endeavor there’s a period 
of trying things out to see 
what fits.  At least right now 
we are an amateur, non-au-
ditioned group so I just 
picked out six short pieces 
and we’ve worked to refine 
these and had some fun 
singing rounds and working 
on building skills and confi-
dence.”  
	 The Camerata will be 
joined by guest soloists April 
Streeter, mezzo-soprano 
and Emma Strange, so-
prano. “These are two very 
young very talented singers 
from northern Vermont.  It’s 
a pleasure to offer them an 
audience.”
	 A gala reception follows 
the Concert.  Free Admis-
sion.
	 Questions?  Call Victoria 
Cole, Music Director at 603-
728-7022. Email: victoria.
cole1@gmail.com

Concert Debut of 
White Mountains Camerata
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	 The deadline for the NH 
House of Representatives 
to finalize a budget proposal 
for legislative approval and 
submission to Governor for 
the upcoming biennium is 
fast approaching. Republi-
cans, who control the legis-
lature and the corner office, 
are struggling to reach a 
compromised budget.  For 
the first time in years, the 
House failed several months 
ago to approve and forward 
the budget to the Senate. 
This left the task of develop-
ing the next state budget to 
the Senate.  The Senate has 
since constructed a $11.8 
Billion state budget, but that 
document and its bottom 
line is causing heartburn for 
some who are threatening to 
scuttle the proposal.
	 House Republicans are 
divided on the budget issue.  
A small contingent of House 
members have formed a 
group called the “Freedom 
Caucus,” which is very simi-
lar to the conservative coun-
terpart in Washington.  Sev-
eral months ago, this group 
joined a majority of Demo-
crats in voting down the orig-
inal House budget proposal 
that should have been sent 
to the Senate.  Freedom 
Caucus members wanted to 
further cut the already lean 
budget, while Democrats 
opposed the budget for op-
posite reasons. Together the 
divergent perspectives vot-
ed to reject the House posi-
tion.  The Senate has since 
developed and forwarded 
their proposal to the House.  
As of this writing, House 
leadership is reworking the 
Senate’s version of the bud-
get in hopes of attracting a 
majority necessary to move 

the bill forward to the Gov-
ernor. Democrats argue that 
the budget does not go far 
enough in providing assis-
tance to those with mental 
illness, those requiring sub-
stance abuse intervention, 
and assisting children at 
risk of abuse.  Further, the 
minority questions revenue 
cuts that Republicans are 
seeking by reducing the 
state’s business profits and 
enterprise tax rates.  Oth-
ers, Republican and Demo-
crat, have concern that the 
Senate’s budget does not 
contain the annual $9 Million 
necessary to support full-
day kindergarten. It is hoped 
that state support for full-day 
kindergarten will help off set 
funds raised currently by 
towns like Haverhill. 
	 Governor Sununu pre-
sented a budget that con-
tained full-day kindergar-
ten, support for NH’s opioid 
epidemic, funds for capi-
tal improvement projects, 
scholarship funding for post 
secondary education that 
will better support NH’s 
workforce requirements, 
and more.  All members of 
the House should come to-
gether and compromise on 
this critical issue. The many 
negative ramifications and 
fallout that may occur if the 
House fails again to pass a 
sensible, balanced budget 
could be devastating to the 
state.  Governor Sununu 
and the citizens of New 
Hampshire deserve legis-
lative support and a fiscally 
responsible budget. 

Respectfully Submitted,
NH Rep Rick Ladd, Haverhill
Chairman, House Education

Budget…Not a Slam Dunk!
By Marianne L. Kelly

	 Barnet, VT — Spring 
brings rain, flowers and bu-
colic mountain scenery. This 
April also brought Barnet 
Mountain Meats to the area.
	 “We have two smoke-
houses out back, my hus-
band David and I have al-
ways raised pigs, and David 
has always smoked ham 
and bacon,” said Lori Wright. 
She and David decided that 
they wanted to turn smoking 
meats into a business, but 
first they had to jump many 
hurdles to meet the very 
strict building and meat in-
spection requirements of the 
State of Vermont.
	 “My husband has always 
loved smoking meats, and I 
wanted to have something 
that I could do at home,” said 
Lori, a former home health 
care nurse.
	 Her favorite part of her 
business is serving her cus-
tomers, and “I actually don’t 
mind doing the paper work 
at all,” she said. 
	 The state inspector dis-
couraged them from working 
outside, and when he cited 
all the changes and building 
that would have to be done 
to be able to use the two 
smokehouses, they decided 
it was easier and more effi-
cient to remodel a building 
on the property, bring it up to 
state standards, rather than 
David climbing up the bank 
in winter and hauling wood 
to smoke the meats. The 
new building is also safer 
and more convenient for the 
Wrights and their custom-
ers. “This is so much easier,” 
said Lori.
	 The Wrights meats were 
so popular among family 
and friends. They realized 
they just might have a good 
retail operation, and decid-
ed to take the plunge . “We 
sometimes did custom work 
for people who raised their 
own pigs, but have not re-

ceived a lot of volume on 
that front yet,” said Lori.
	 “We’re keeping busy with 
the retail part of the business 
right now,” she said, add-
ing, “We’ve got quite a few 
stores selling our meat, and 
it looks like we may be get-
ting more.” At the moment 
Barnet Mountain Meats can 
be found in the Newbury Vil-
lage Store, Marty’s 1st Stop 
in Danville, and CC in Bar-
ton, and most recently all 
three White’s Markets in St. 
Johnsbury and two in Lyn-
donville respectively. “We 
just ordered a new and larg-
er machine to accommodate  
all the vacuum packing that 
we must do.” 
	 “Right now,” said Lori, 
“We just have our apple tree 
smoked bacon, and are go-
ing through HAACP
(Hazard Analysis & Criti-
cal Control Point) program. 
After 90 days, if we pass 
the inspection, we will add 
smoked sausage.” They 
plan on offering maple 
breakfast sausages to start, 
“ then go through all our rec-
ipes and add one at a time. 
We will not offer links, but 
will shape the sausages into 
rounds and patties so they 
can more easily be used for 
spaghetti and other sauces.” 
said Lori. They expect to 
have the sausage available 
in late summer or fall.
	 They also are looking 
forward to offering ham at 
some point. “We have to do 
one product at a time, so we 
can make sure everything 
is done properly, including 
all the lab tests required for 
meat and recipes. The la-
bels will be full disclosure 
so everyone knows exactly 
what’s in our meats. We will 
specialize in bacon, sau-
sage and ham.”
	 “We get all our meat lo-
cally through PT Farm in 
No. Haverhill. They deliver 
boneless, skinless pork bel-
lies for the bacon. We put 

them in brine, and smoke 
the meats on Wednesdays 
and Thursdays, then slice 
and wrap and everything is 
ready for the store and our 
customers. We weigh them 
several times before final 
packaging.”
	 “We have  three grades 
of bacon,” said Lori.  “A” is 
the very best, which is the 
thickest slabs of bacon. “B”  
is good but not as perfect as 
“A”. Size might be different, 
there might be a bit more 
fat. It’s all perfect, just a bit 
irregular. “C” are ends.” The 
prices reflect the grade. Best 
is $7.25 lb, average 
$6.75 lb. ends are $6.00 lb.
	 They have advertised 
on radio station 101.5 in St. 
Johnsbury, the Caledonian 
Record, the Bridge Weekly 
and Trendy Times to intro-
duce their new business to 
the area.
	 Apparently the radio and 
print advertising are bring-
ing new people to their door.  
It is not unusual to hear “I 
heard it on the radio, or saw 
it in the paper,” noted Lori.
	 Lori is currently promot-
ing her bacon through Pete 
and Jerry’s Organic Eggs  
and Marty’s 1st Stop. Buy 
1lb. Of bacon at Marty’s 1st 
stop and Pete and Jerry’s 
will give you one dozen large 
organic eggs, while supplies 
last.
	 Visit Lori at Barnet Moun-
tain Meats Tuesday through 
Saturday from 9-5. There is 
a flag outside the building to 
welcome you.
	 For more information call 
(802) 633-2502.
	 Lori and David Wright are 
delightful and knowledge-
able, and people you should 
know.

Someone you should know...
Lori and David Wright: Barnet Mountain Meats

Your journey will be much lighter if 
you don’t carry your past with you.

Biofield Tuning is a unique 
therapeutic method that uses 
Sound Waves produced by 
Tuning Forks in the biofield, 

surrounding the human body. 
It is a simple, non-invasive, 
and efficient therapy that 
produces profound and 
powerful outcomes by 

removing the emotions that 
we carry from our past.  

Barbara Smith: 
Certified Biofield Practitioner

REIKI RETREAT (802) 757 2809
90 Farm St., E. Ryegate, VT

\reikiretreat@charter.net  
WWW.Vtreikiretreat.com
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by Gary Scruton
 
  Another season has got-
ten off to a great start at Old 
Church Theater in Bradford. 
The first production of the 
year “One Night in the Val-
ley” was also a world pre-
mier for this complete per-
formance. Combined, these 
two facts led to some well 
attended performances for 
this amateur group of actors 
and other volunteers. 
    This is not the first time 
that a world premier has 
happened at Old Church 
Theater. Playwright Tony 
Sportiello also wrote and 
premiered at OCT “Second 
Chance” which went on to 
play in Dallas and London. 
Due to some scheduling is-
sue the playwright was un-
able to show up for opening 
night of this production, but 
instead showed up for the 
second Friday night of the 
performance. Many other 
people also showed up that 
night at this local gem. 
    The performers, as well 
as the director, were not first 
timers however. Though a 
couple of the cast were mak-
ing their debut at OCT they 
already had plenty of experi-
ence playing in front of audi-
ences at other theaters. The 
remainder of the cast, and 
director Diane Chamberlin, 
are familiar names and fac-
es at OCT. And it showed! 
    The play was billed as 
three separate stories all 
happening at the same 
time, but in different homes 
around the San Bernardino 
Valley. The challenge given 
to the crowd was to figure 
out what they all had in com-
mon and therefore how they 
were tied together. 

    Another billing for this per-
formance was that there was 
some “adult” language. I will 
tell you that yes there were 
some lines that one could 
not say on TV, but it was by 
no means overwhelming, 
and seemed to be placed 
in appropriate times without 
any great fanfare. To me 
this goes to the credit of the 
playwright for well chosen 
words, and to the actors for 
using the words written as 
they were intended. 
    At the conclusion of the Fri-
day, June 9 performance the 
playwright took questions 
and made comments which 
gave all that were in atten-
dance a unique perspective 
to the play we had just seen. 
It was at this time that we 
learned that two of the three 
portions (the chess game & 
the marriage) of the play had 
been written and performed 
previously. The difference 
was that they were per-
formed as stand alone, one 
act plays. It was not until the 
third portion (the opera sing-
er) was added, and a few re-
visions were written in, that 
this became a “full evening” 
of entertainment. 
    Regarding the challenge 
to the audience of deciding 
what the catch was to pull 
all three stories together, it 
was, like any good mystery, 
not revealed until late in 
the play even though there 
were certainly plenty of hints 
along the way. 
    Though I have enjoyed 
many seasons of being a 
member of play audiences, I 
can not recall a performance 
where all the actors (with 
one exception) were on 
stage all the time, whether 
acting or not. In fact all these 

actors probably spent more 
time sitting or standing still in 
the dark, than they spent un-
der the spotlights. This was 
done by quickly changing 
from one scene to the next 
with the simple turning on 
or off of certain lights. This 
is not to say that the per-
formance was choppy. Just 
the opposite. It moved along 
smoothly and flawlessly as 
the performers picked up 
where they left off the last 
time their lights were up. 
    One of the other interest-
ing aspects of this play is 
that the author stated that 
on his way back to New York 
he planned on writing in 
some revisions. That means 
that this play will never be 
performed the same ever 
again. Mr. Sportiello certain-
ly enjoyed this performance 
but made the statement that  
it’s “impossible to know what 
you have” until you actually 
see it performed. Now that 
he has, he has some fine 
tuning to make it even better. 
    The people of Old Church 
Theater should be proud 
of what they presented on 
opening weekend. The one 
issue is that the bar has 
been set high for the remain-
der of the season. I look for-
ward to seeing this troupe 
reach those heights.

World Premier Performance Opens 
Old Church Theater Season 	 Devin Foley, who attends 

St. Johnsbury Academy has 
been selected by the Amer-
ican Legion Auxiliary Ross-
Wood Unit #20 to attend ALA 
Granite Girls State. Devin 
will meet approximately 100 
other students from com-
munities throughout New 
Hampshire also selected to 
attend Granite Girls State. 
	 ALA Granite Girls State 
is a mythical state pat-
terned after the State of 
New Hampshire and follows 
New Hampshire govern-
ment procedure as closely 
as possible. It is a program 
of the American Legion Aux-
iliary and is for High School 
girls that have complet-
ed their junior year of High 
School. These young ladies 
will learn first-hand how the 
State of New Hampshire 
and their  local town and city 
governments work. The girls 
will elect their own town, city, 
county and state officials. 
They will have a chance to 
act out a typical city, town 
and county meeting. They 
will receive knowledge of 
the two-party system, hold 
a caucus, hold  Primary 

elections, a convention rally 
and General Legislative ses-
sions. They will have their 
own legislature where they 
introduce, debate and make 
their own bills. 
	 ALA Granite Girls State 
is being held at St. Anselm’s 
College located in Manches-
ter, New Hampshire week 
of June 25th - June 30th, 
2017. These young ladies 
will spend an intense week 
of study, working together as 
self-governing citizens. The 
American Legion Auxiliary 
selects these young women 
and find sponsors to help 
pay the cost. 
	 Two of these young la-
dies will be selected to go 
to Washington, DC to repre-
sent New Hampshire at ALA 
Girls Nation. They will be 
among about 100 girls se-
lected nation-wide to repre-
sent their state. While there, 
they will learn about the Fed-
eral government, possibly 
meet President Trump, and 
the Senators and Represen-
tatives from New Hampshire 
and visit several of the me-
morials, including Arlington 
Cemetery. 

Local Student To Attend 73rd 
Session of ALA Granite Girls State

LITTLETON MOTORSPORTS
515 Union St. • Littleton, NH • 603-444-5003 • M-F 8-5, Sat. 8-3

www.littletonmotorsports.com • TAX-FREE NEW HAMPSHIRE

Largest Selection of MOTORCYCLES 
in the NORTH COUNTRY & THE N.E.K.!

Cruisers • Touring • Sport
• Dual Sport • Off Road • Youth

Check Out the 
ALL NEW
Z900

or the
Versys 
X300Vulcan Voyager 1700 Z900

LITTLETON MOTORSPORTS
515 Union St. • Littleton, NH • 603-444-5003 • M-F 8-5, Sat. 8-3

www.littletonmotorsports.com • TAX-FREE NEW HAMPSHIRE

OFF ROAD!
In-Stock SIDE-BY-SIDES!
• All Mule Models
• Teryx - 2 & 4-seaters
• ALL with 3-YEAR Warranties!

Both with Loader and
Quick-Attach HD Bucket

 PLUS 0% for 60 Mo.
FINANCING!

 PLUS 0% for 60 Mo.
FINANCING!

LITTLETON MOTORSPORTS
515 Union St. • Littleton, NH • 603-444-5003 • M-F 8-5, Sat. 8-3

www.littletonmotorsports.com • TAX-FREE NEW HAMPSHIRE

MAY ‘Utility Tractor’ SALE!
New Holland
TRACTORS

Workmaster 33 
12x12 with Loader $19,900 Cash

Littleton Motorsportsat

*0% for Credit-Qualified Buyers. See dealer for details.

Workmaster 60 
Utility

NOW $31,500

Workmaster 50 
Utility

NOW $29,900

FINANCING 
up to 84 Mo.

WARRANTY!NOW! 6-YEAR

LITTLETON MOTORSPORTS
515 Union St. • Littleton, NH • 603-444-5003 • M-F 8-5, Sat. 8-3

www.littletonmotorsports.com • TAX-FREE NEW HAMPSHIRE

BOATS ARE IN! at Littleton Motorsports!
Check out our Selection of 

Pontoon & Fishing Boats!

SALE on 2016 Leftovers!   All powered by

It’s Time to register for the 2010 4th of July Parade. 
 

Registration is FREE.  The fun is FREE.  There are even CASH prizes. 

The parade steps off at 11 AM on Sunday, July 4th.  All entries should be checked in by 10 AM. 
For further details, contact Parade Chairman Steve Strout at 603-747-2878 

or visit www.wwr4thofjuly.com for the full 4th of July schedule. 

It’s Time To Register For the 4th of July Parade in Woodsville/Wells River
CASH Prizes: FREE Registration. 
2017 Theme: Peace-Love-Freedom

The parade steps off at 11 AM on Tuesday, July 4th. All entries should be checked in by 10 AM.
For further details, contact Parade Chairman Steven Strout at 603-747-2878

Sale on 

2016 Leftover 

Starcrafts
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Calendar of Events
A Full Page of Events from Local Non-Profits, Schools and Towns. Presented FREE by Trendy Times.

Ongoing Weekly Events

TUESDAY, JUNE 13
NH STATE VETERANS COUNCIL
REPRESENTATIVE
8:30 AM – 12:00 Noon
Woodsville American Legion Post #20

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 14
MONTHLY MEETING - ROSS-WOOD 
POST #20 AMERICAN LEGION
6:00 PM
7:00 PM ANNUAL FLAG BURNING CERE-
MONY
American Legion Post, Woodsville
See Ad on Page ???

THURSDAY, JUNE 15
VFW POST #5245 MONTHLY MEETING
7:00 PM
VFW Hall, North Haverhill

FRIDAY, JUNE 16
ALL-YOU-CAN-EAT SPAGHETTI DINNER. T
5:00 - 7:00 PM
American Legion Hall, 37 Main Street, Ashland

SATURDAY, JUNE 17
STRAWBERRY FESTIVAL & FLEA MARKET
First Congregational Church, Haverhill

FATHERS DAY OXEN PULL
10:00 AM
North Haverhill Fairgrounds
See Ad on Page 8

(NOT SO) ELEMENTARY, MY DEAR WAT-
SON. 
1:00 p.m., 
Joseph Patch Library, Warren
See Article on Page 9

A COUNTRY AFTERNOON TEA 
2:00 PM
Sugar Hill Meetinghouse   

CAMERA! LIGHTS! ORAL HISTORIES! RHU-
BARB!
6:30 p.m.
Fellowship Hall, Lower Waterford Road See 
Article on Page 9

SUNDAY, JUNE 18
FATHER DAY HORSE PULL
10:00 AM
North Haverhill Fairgrounds
See Ad on Page 8

BENEFIT TEXAS HOLD “EM POKER
11:00 AM Cash Game 1:30 Tournament 
Breslin Center, Main Street, Lyndonville

TUESDAY, JUNE 20
DOCUMENTARY FILM: HUNGRY HEARTS
7:00 PM
Wells River Congregational Church
See Ad on Page 17

“COVERED BRIDGES OF NEW HAMPSHIRE” 
 7:00 PM 
 Alumni Hall, 75 Court St., Haverhill Corner.
See Article on Page 9

THURSDAY, JUNE 22
WHITE MOUNTAINS CAMERATA
7:30 pm 
All Saints Episcopal Church, Littleton
See Article on Page 3

SATURDAY, JUNE 24
4TH  ANNUAL WELLS RIVER PICNIC
9:00 AM/Fflea Market thru 1:45 Ice Cream
Elizabeth Berry Park, Rourt 5 Sourth, Wells River

Wells River Community Picnic
9:00 AM 
Berry Memorial Field, Wells River
See Article & Ad on Page 8 

TAG SALE
9:00 AM - 2:00 PM
St. Luke’s Episcopal Church, Woodsville
See Ad on Page 7

VANISHED VETERANS
2:00 PM
Bath Historical House, 15 Lisbon Road, Bath
See Article on Page 9

PULLED PORK, BRISKET SUPPER 
5:30 - 7:00 PM  / Newtown Military Band 7:00 PM
United Congregational Church of Orford UCC

SUNDAY, JUNE 25
HAVERHILL REC  ACOUSTIC MUSIC JAM
12:00 NOON - 4:00 PM
Clifford Memorial Building, Woodsville

JEREMIAH INGALLS SINGERS
3:00 PM
Old Goshen Church, Bradford

MONDAY, JUNE 26
HAVERHILL SELECT BOARD MEETING
6:00 PM
Morrill Municipal Building, North Haverhill

TUESDAY, JULY 4
WOODSVILLE/WELLS RIVER PARADE
11:00 AM
Central St., Woodsville - Main St., Wells River
See Page 5 for Ad

4TH OF JULY BBQ
3:30 - 6:30 PM - Adults $6/ Children $4
American Legion Post #83, Lincoln

AAron Audet Band
6:30 - 8:00 PM
Fairlee Town Common

FRIDAY, JULY 14
AMERICAN LEGION RIDERS MONTHLY MEETING
6:00 PM
American Legion Home, Woodsville

BENEFIT TEXAS HOLD “EM POKER
11:00 AM Cash Game 1:30 Tournament
American Legion Post 30, Rt. 5, Lyndon

SUNDAY, JULY 23
THE TABOR VALLEY SINGERS
3:00 PM
Old Goshen Church, Bradford

SUNDAY, AUGUST 6
ANNUAL OLD GOSHEN CHURCH MEETING
2:00 PM
Old Goshen Church, Bradford

MONDAYS
NEK Council On Aging’s Hot Meals
11:30 AM - St. Johnsbury House
NOON - Darling Inn, Lyndonville
Adult Strength Training
1:30 - 2:30 PM - North Congregational 
Church, St. Johnsbury
9 AM – 10 AM
Municipal Offices, Lyndonville
10:30 AM – 11:30 AM
Municipal Offices, Lyndonville
Bingo - 6:00 PM
Orange East Senior Center, Bradford
TOPS (Take Off Pounds Sensibly)
6:00 PM - Peacham School
Kiwanis Club of St Johnsbury
6:15 PM - VFW Post, Eastern Ave.

MONDAYS/WEDNESDAYS
RSVP Bone Builders
10:30 AM –11:30 AM
Linwood Senior Center, Lincoln

MONDAYS/THURSDAYS
Adult Interval Aerobics Class - 6:30 
Woodsville Elementary School
Golden Ball Tai Chi

8:30 – 9:15 AM – St. Johnsbury House

TUESDAYS
Breakfast By Donation
8:30 AM – 10:00 AM
Horse Meadow Senior Center, 
North Haverhill
Adult Strength Training
9 AM – 10 AM - St. Johnsbury House
10:30 AM – 11:30 AM
Senior Action Center
Methodist Church, Danville
NEK Council On Aging’s Hot Meals
11:30 AM - St. Johnsbury House
NOON - Senior Action Center,
Methodist Church, Danville
NOON - Presbyterian Church, S. Ryegate
NOON - Darling Inn, Lyndonville
TOPS (Take Off Pounds Sensibly)
Weigh In 5:00 PM – Meeting 6:00 PM
Horse Meadow Senior Center, N. Haverhill
Emergency Food Shelf
4:30 PM – 5:30 PM
Wells River Congregational Church
Community Dinner Bell - 5:00 PM
All Saints’ Church, School St., Littleton
AA Meeting (Open Big Book)
7:00 PM – 8:00 PM
St. Luke’s Parish Hall, Woodsville

TUESDAYS/THURSDAYS
Active Older Adult Strength Class
1:30 PM
Woodsville Post Office, S. Court St
Growing Stronger Fitness Class
 3:00 PM 
East Haven Library
TUESDAYS/FRIDAYS
Golden Ball Tai Chi
8:30 AM – 9:15 AM
First Congregational Church, Lyndonville
WEDNESDAYS
Aqua Aerobics
Evergreen Pool, Rte 302, Lisbon
Adult Strength Training
1:30 - 2:30 PM - North Congregational 
Church, St. Johnsbury
Bingo - 6:30 PM
Haverhill Memorial VFW Post #5245
North Haverhill
Cribbage - 7:00 PM
Orange East Senior Center, Bradford
WEDNESDAYS/FRIDAYS
NEK Council On Aging’s Hot Meals
11:30 AM - St. Johnsbury House
NOON - Presbyterian Church, West Barnet
NOON - Darling Inn, Lyndonville

THURSDAYS
Adult Strength Training
10:30 AM – 11:30 AM
Senior Action Center
Methodist Church, Danville
NEK Council On Aging’s Hot Meals
11:30 AM - St. Johnsbury House
NOON - Senior Action Center,
Methodist Church, Danville
NOON - Darling Inn, Lyndonville
St Paul’s Bible Study on James, 6:15 
PM, 113 Main St., Lancaster
FRIDAYS
Adult Strength Training
9 AM – 10 AM - St. Johnsbury House
1:30 - 2:30 PM - North Congregational 
Church, St. Johnsbury
Worship Under The Tent- 7 PM
100 Horse Meadow Rd, No Haverhill
AA Meeting (Open Discussion)
8:00 PM – 9:00 PM
Methodist Church, Maple St, Woodsville
SUNDAYS
Cribbage - 1:00 PM
American Legion Post #83, Lincoln
North Danville Baptist Church (ABC), 
Worship and Sunday School, 9:30 AM
Refreshments at 10:20 a.m.
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Every Tuesday:  8:30 
Community Breakfast

June 13 
Nifty Needlers @ 9:00

Working w/Clay @ 1:00
June 14 

Beading/Jewelry @ 9:00
Bone Builders @ 9:30

Writer’s Group @ 10:30
Eyeglass Care @ 11:30

Bingo @ 1:00
Mahjongg @ 1:00

June 15
Art Class w/ Barb @ 9:00

Diabetes Talk @ 12:15
Cribbage @ 12:30

Line Dancing @ 12:45
June 16

Bone Builders @ 9:30
Mahjongg @ 10:30

Cone Wreath Craft @ 1:00
Tai Ji Quan @ 2:00

June 19
Bone Builders @ 9:30

Hearts & Hands Quilters @ 
12:30

MS Support @ 1:00
Tai Ji Quan @ 2:00

June 20
Nifty Needlers @ 9:00

Working w/Clay @ 1:00
June 21

Bone Builders @ 9:30
Writer’s Group @ 10:30

Bingo @ 1:00
Mahjongg @ 1:00
June 22: CLOSED
June 23: CLOSED
June 26: CLOSED

June 27:
Nifty Needlers @ 9:00

Frame Craft w/Bob @ 1:00
June 28:

Bone Builders @ 9:30
	 Writer’s Group @ 10:30
	 Eyeglass Care @
	 Bingo @ 1:00
	 Mahjongg @ 1:00

June 29:
Art Class w/ Barb @ 9:00

Cribbage @ 12:30
Line Dancing @ 12:45

Painting on Slate w/Kim @ 
1:00

June 30:
Bone Builders @ 9:30

Mahjongg @ 10:30
Cone Wreath Craft @ 1:00

Tai Ji Quan @ 2:00

Horse Meadow 
Senior Center

	 The Bath Library Book 
Club will be discussing “City 
of Women”, by David Gill-
ham, on Thursday, July 13th 
at 6 pm at the Bath Public 
Library. 
	 On the surface, Sigrid 
Schröder is the model Ger-
man soldier’s wife, but be-
hind this façade is an entire-
ly different Sigrid, a woman 
of passion who dreams of 
her former Jewish lover, now 
lost in the chaos of the sec-

ond world war.
	 Books may be picked up 
at the Bath Library; hours are 
Tuesdays, Wednesdays and 
Thursdays 9:00am to noon 
and 1:00 pm to 6:00 pm 
and Saturdays 9:00 am to 
noon. Anyone with an inter-
est in reading and convers-
ing about books is welcome 
to attend. For information, 
please contact the library at 
603-747-3372 or email bath-
librarykjb@gmail.com 

	 Our Expanding So-
lar System: Astronomy & 
Myth. Friday, June 23 at 
4pm.  Family-friendly & free!   
Come learn about the newly 
discovered planetoids in our 
far solar system, as well as 
the indigenous creator gods 
and goddesses for whom 
they are named!  We’ll also 
consider a different answer 
to the question: Is Pluto a 
planet?  Pencils & crayons 
will be on hand, along with 
the new Planetary Gods & 
Goddesses Coloring Book. 
Program led by Kelley Hunt-
er, Ph.D., a longtime astrolo-
ger, mythologist & stargazer.
	 Book Discussion: Mon-
day, June 26 at 6:30pm.  
Join us for our next book 
group gathering to talk about 
“The Road Home,” a novel 
by Rose Tremain.  Copies 
of the book are available to 
loan from the library.  New 
folks always welcome!
	 Meet Our Town Trucks! 
Wednesday, June 28 at 

10:00am.  We all love trucks 
& the folks who drive them, 
and now you can spend a 
morning in the driver’s seat!  
Meet our local crew who 
keeps our roads safe, and 
find out more about their 
job, tools, & trucks.  Hosted 
in the Library parking lot, so 
please plan to park your own 
vehicle at another lot nearby.
	 Crafts & Conversation: 
Every Wednesday from 
1-3pm.  Stop in or stay a 
while during this friendly DIY 
craft and conversation time.  
All levels of crafty folks wel-
come to share tips, ideas & 
good cheer!
	 All of our programs are 
free and open to residents of 
all towns. 
	 Find us on Facebook 
(Groton Free Public Library).
or contact Anne: grotonli-
braryvt@gmail.com, 802-
584-3358.
	 Open M (2:30-7) W (10-
4) F (2:30-7) Sat (10-12).

	 All events held at the Se-
nior Center are open to the 
public unless otherwise ad-
vertised.
 	 No Strings Attached will 
be playing music on Friday, 
June 23 starting at 11:00 
a.m.
 	 The Orange East Senior 
Center will be closed on 
Monday, July 3 and Tues-
day, July 4 in observance of 
Independence Day
 	 Tai Chi class is on 
Wednesdays at 10:30 a.m. 
instructed by Ursula Austin 
who is certified on Fall Pre-
vention Tai Chi.
 	 The Foot Clinic 2nd 
and 4th Wednesday of the 
month, if you would like an 
appointment please call.
 	 Bingo is every Monday 
at 6:00 p.m. The doors will 
open at 5:00 p.m.  The kitch-
en will be open selling drinks 
and food.
 	 Computer class winter 
hours will be on Wednes-
days from 3:00 p.m. until 

5:00 p.m. This class is for all 
levels.
 	 The Orange East Senior 
Center is available for rent.  
We have a capacity of 125.  
If you would like to book 
your wedding reception or 
birthday party or if you have 
any questions, please give 
us a call.
 	 If you are in need of any 
medical equipment, please 
check with Vicky to see if we 
have it to borrow before you 
purchase any.
 	 There is space available 
in the Monday, Tuesday, 
Thursday and Friday exer-
cise class. The class be-
gins at 9:00 a.m. and ends 
at 10:00. The Tuesday and 
Thursday exercise class is a 
strength and balance class.
 	 Orange East Senior Cen-
ter is holding informal Line 
Dancing classes for exer-
cise and just plain fun, each 
Tuesday at 10 a.m. Come 
On Down! 

	 Your children are invited 
to join Bath Public Library’s 
Summer Reading Program 
and attend the fun programs 
and events we are planning 
for children preschool to 12. 
This summer’s theme, “Build 
a Better World”, explores 
all kinds of ways in prepar-
ing children for success by 
developing early language 
skills. The programs are free 
and open to children of all 
abilities.
	 The Bath Public Library 
cares about your children 
and has planned programs 
to keep them reading and 
learning all summer. Wheth-
er keeping track of the 
amount of time your children 
spend reading or the num-
ber of books they have read 
this summer, children who 
join the Summer Reading 

Program keep their minds 
active and enter school in 
the fall ready to learn and 
ready to succeed. 
	 Planned activities in-
clude: the Children’s Mu-
seum of New Hampshire, 
a theatre group performing 
Beauty & the Beast, Maker-
space Fun, a CLiF present-
er and book giveaway, and 
a balloon artist & ice cream 
social – every Wednesday 
morning at 10:00, from June 
28 through July 26. Come 
join the fun!
	 Stop by the Bath Pub-
lic Library for a schedule of 
events and registration form 
for our 2017 Summer Read-
ing Program. Contact us at 
bathlibrarykjb@gmail.com 
or call 747-3372 for more in-
formation.

Want to Connect to Other Readers? 
Join the Bath Book Club!

Groton Free Public Library News

Orange East Senior Center

Children’s Summer Reading 
Program at Bath Public Library

Including a Special 
Selection of 
Antiques

TAG
 SALE

Saturday, June 24
9:00 AM - 2:00 PM

St. Luke’s Episcopal Church
Corner of Central & Church Street, Woodsville

Food 
Sale Too!!

Rain 
Or Shine

www.TrendyThreadsWoodsville.com 

 
 
 

WE NEED MORE 

Trendy Threads 
 9:30 to 5:00 

Wednesday - Friday 
1st & 3rd Saturday 

 

171 Central St. 
Woodsville, NH 
603-747-3870       

Children’s sizes 4-12 
Music CD’s 

Movie DVD’s 
 

Consider joining the 1200+ already 
consigning with Trendy Threads. 

 

June is the last month to bring in Summer 
items.  Fall/Winter items accepted July -  
December.  Full consignment guidelines 

available on website or at the store. 
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	 Wells River Action Pro-
gram has added several new 
events and activities to their 
annual community picnic 
and ice cream social to be 
held on June 24th. This year 
a flea market, food, children 
activities and music have 
been added.  There are still 
some spaces available for 
the flea market, and regis-
tration forms may be picked 
up at the Baldwin Library or 
by emailing wrapwr@gmail.
com. Forms and the $10.00 
registration fee are due June 
16th.
	 You can again bring 
your own picnic or this year 
choose to purchase your 
picnic items -- hot dogs, 
soda, chips, lemonade and 
popcorn etc from on site 
vendors. Also new this year, 
Jazzy’s Children Fund will 
provide a number of kid’s 
activities, and Pam and the 
Rusty Rangers will provide 
music. 
	 The Newbury Historical 
Society will host a Newbury 
version of Story Corps be-
ginning at 11:00pm. Histor-
ical Society members will 
be on hand until 1:00pm to 
record personal short sto-
ries about an event or re-
membrance that occurred in 
Newbury, involved Newbury 
residents or has/had a New-
bury connection.  This can 
be something that happened 
last week or something that 
happen a few years ago or 
many years ago.  

	 The Vermont Institute of 
Nature Science (VINS) will 
return with another Raptor 
Program.  Sponsored by 
the Baldwin Memorial Li-
brary the program begins at 
1:00pm. The day ends with 
WRAP serving ice cream 
at the conclusion at about 
1:45pm.
	 The picnic is June 24th.  
The flea market will begin at 
9:00am, music at 10:00, sto-
ry corps, food, children activ-
ities at 11:00 and raptors at 
1:00. The day ends with free 
ice cream at about 1:45pm. 
All events take place just 
south of Wells River Village 
at the Berry Memorial Field 
at 143 Main Street North.
	 The wider Wells Riv-
er Community is invited to 
come enjoy our wonderful 
park, visit with some of your 
neighbors, enjoy a picnic, 
hear some music or a tell a 
story, or learn about raptors 
in an entertaining way, and 
have some ice cream.  At-
tendees should bring their 
own chairs, blankets, pop-
up canopies, non-alcoholic 
beverages and insect repel-
lent and sun block.
	 Limited parking will be 
provided but the general 
public is encouraged to park 
in downtown Wells River and 
walk or bike to Berry Field.  
	 For more information 
contact Pam Kinney at 802 
588 -5038, Judith Sawyer at 
802 588- 5020  or by email - 
wrapwr@gmail.com

4th Annual Wells River 
Picnic Expands

	 The schedule for the 73rd 
annual North Haverhill Fair 
is now complete. This family 
fair has gained a reputation 
for outstanding entertain-
ment on the Thayer Stage 
as well as in the other ven-
ues. And they are all free 
with your paid gate admis-
sion. 
	 The final piece to this 
year’s schedule was “Hot 
Blooded - The Foreigner Ex-
perience” which will appear 
on Friday, July 28 at 8:30 
pm on Thayer Stage. Songs 
like “Cold As Ice” and “Juke-
box Hero” are just two of the 
iconic sounds that this band 
covers with an experience 
that will not soon be forgot-
ten. This group will continue 
the recent string of top notch 
tribute bands that have been 
crowd pleasing, and en-
tertainment fulfilling. Most 
seats for this concert are on 
a first come first serve basis, 
with room for you to bring 
your own chair, or find a seat 
in the bleachers. 
	 On Saturday night, July 
29, NH based Recycled Per-
cussion takes over the stage 
with their unique style of 
musical performance. Again 
this concert is free with paid 
general admission. 
	 Other music on Thayer 
Stage will include Wednes-
day night with the Deca-
to-Sanborn Project per-
forming their version of 

Americana music. This band 
fills the air with music at 7:00 
PM on Thayer Stage. This 
performance follows the Lit-
tle Miss North Haverhill Fair 
competition that will show-
case these young ladies tal-
ent and ability to answer a 
couple of questions. 
	 Thursday night on the 
Thayer Stage will see the re-
turn of North Haverhill’s Got 
Talent at 6:00 pm.  Deadline 
for applications is July 21. 
Check the website for full 
details. Also happening on 
Wednesday and Thursday 
will be the return of “Minute 
To Win It”. This gives those 
in the crowd the opportunity 
to step up and try to win priz-
es or cash for performing a 
small task in 60 seconds or 
less. It’s great fun for those 
watching as well as those 
volunteering. 
	 The final performance on 
Thayer Stage for the 2017 
North Haverhill Fair will be  
the Mark Shelton Band and 
their Elvis Tribute. Mark is 

well known in the northeast 
for his tribute shows as well 
as his life story. Again, all 
these shows are free with 
your paid general admis-
sion. 
	 Another site with great 
action every day of the fair 
is the 300’ clay pulling track. 
The action starts with the 
ever popular Demolition Der-
bies. Wednesday will feature 
the 6 & 8 cylinder demo der-
bies as well as the mini van 
division. The second night of 
collision clashes will be Fri-
day with the 4 cylinder divi-
sion plus the second year of 
the Power Wheels division 
for the younger set. Check 
out the fair’s website for full 
details and rules. 
	 A new event at this ven-
ue this year will be Thursday 
night’s Log Loader competi-
tion. This event will bring in 
some new talent showing 
off what they can do with 
these familiar trucks and 
the equipment attached. 
The $1,000 first prize purse 
is sure to kick up the com-
petition a notch and should 
be great entertainment. Full 
rules for this event will be on 
the web site soon. 
	 The entertainment does 
not stop there. Saturday has 
the long standing tradition of 
farm, antique and enhanced 
tractors pulling the transfer 
sled down the track. Then 
on Sunday the noise level 
goes up again when the 4x4 
Truck Pull hits the track with 
doodlebugs and 2 wheel 
drive units being featured as 
well. 
    There is always some-
thing special happening at 
the North Haverhill Fair. Oth-
er events include daily ani-
mal pulling events, Woods-
men’s Contest, Car Show, 
Horse Show, and the mag-
ic of Lance Gifford to make 
your visit worth the $12 gate 
admission fee which gets 
you admission to all these 
shows, plus all the other dis-
plays. Children under 12 are 
still Free as is the parking. 
    If you are interested in hit-
ting the Fiesta Show rides 
then check out the special 
on Wednesday, Thursday, 
Friday and Sunday. Again 
details can be found at www.
nohaverhillfair.com

Experience “Hot Blooded - The Foreigner Expierience” 
at the 73rd Annual North Haverhill Fair

4th Annual 
Wells River Community Picnic 

and Ice Cream Social
RAIN or SHINE

Saturday, JUNE 24th 9:00 AM – 2:00 PM    
Berry Memorial Field - 143 Main Street North

FLEA MARKET 
9:00 AM – 2:00 PM  

 Hot Dogs, Soda, Chips Etc 
 11:00 AM – 1:00 PM 

Music:: 10:00 AM - Noon
 Pam and the Rusty Rangers  

 Newbury Historical Society 
Story Corps

 11:00 AM – 1:00 PM 

Baldwin Memorial 
Library presents 

VINS – 
Raptor Nest Building 

1:00 PM

Kids Games  - 
Jazzy’s Children Fund
11:00 AM – 1:00 PM 

 1:45PM

WRAP

SERVES FREE 
ICE CREAM

Bring your own picnic, 
non –alcohol beverage, 

blankets, chairs, pop-up canopy, 
insect repellant and sun screen. 
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	 BATH – Bath Historical 
Society is pleased to pres-
ent George Morrison, “Van-
ished Veterans, NH’s Civil 
War Monuments & Memori-
als” on Saturday, June 24th 
at 2:00 pm at the Bath His-
torical house. 
	 New Hampshire towns 
did not erect monuments to 
prior wars, but the emotional 
and family toll, unprecedent-
ed in American history, drove 
the decision to honor our lo-
cal soldiers and sailors of 
the War of Rebellion. From 
Seabrook to Colebrook, Ber-
lin to Hinsdale, along Main 
Streets and 19th-century dirt 
roads, in city parks and on 
town greens, in libraries and 
town halls, and in cemeter-
ies prominent and obscure, 
George Morrison located, 
inventoried, and photo-
graphed the fascinating va-
riety of New Hampshire’s 
Civil War memorials. He 
shares his discoveries, from 
the earliest obelisks, to stat-
uary and artillery, to murals, 

cast iron, stained glass, and 
buildings from the 1860s 
through the 1920s.
	 George Morrison earned 
a BA in History at the Uni-
versity of New Hampshire. 
He served for 27 years as a 
high school teacher. A long-
time researcher of unpub-
lished primary sources, Mor-
rison has contributed to the 
work of numerous aviation 
historians and artists in sev-
eral countries. He is a life-
long photographer, historian, 
and motorcyclist. Morrison 
has already traveled over 
18,000 miles in the course 
of researching monuments 
and memorials, an interest 
sparked by a puzzling 1918 
monument inscription.
	 This program is free and 
open to the public. There 
will be light refreshments 
served. 
	 For more information, 
contact the Bath Public Li-
brary at 747-3372 or e-mail 
bathlibrarykjb@gmail.com

Vanished Veterans in Bath

	 WATERFORD - Curious 
about “the who” of the Da-
vies Memorial Library?
	 Want to know what it was 
like growing up in the now-
gone village of Upper Wa-
terford on the Connecticut 
River?
	 Interested in how dairy 
farming used to be done in 
a milk house attached to an 
iconic red barn?
	 Come find out in the first 
public reveal of Waterford’s 
videotaped oral histories 
from such long-time resi-
dents as George Bullock, 
Geneva Powers Wright, her 
brother, Willard Powers, sis-
ter-in-law Patricia Wallace 
Powers, and Doris Carol 
Fuller Bonnett. Their stories 
are, by turns, funny and in-
sightful, and capture an era 
that started to disappear with 
the construction of Moore 
Dam in the early 1950s.
	 Designed for anyone with 
a connection to or curiosity 
about the post-Revolution-
ary War town chartered in 
1780, this benefit event in-
cludes a wide variety of de-
licious rhubarb desserts and 
refreshments. 
	 Part of the on-going Wel-
come Home to Waterford 
series, this is the 3rd annu-
al joint fund raiser between 

Vermont’s youngest histori-
cal society and the Congre-
gational Church’s Ladies 
Social Circle.
	 It is scheduled for Sat-
urday, June 17, in the Fel-
lowship Hall at the corner of 
Lower Waterford Road and 
Maple Street. Doors open 
at 6 p.m.; program begins at 
6:30 p.m. The Maple Street 
door is handicap accessible. 
	 Proceeds help the Wa-
terford Historical Society’s 
associated costs for its 
on-going videotaping of 
oral histories and the La-
dies’ steadfast goal to raise 
much-needed restoration 
funds for the historic build-
ing that opened for worship 

in January of 1860. 
	 Seating is limited to 90. 
Tickets are $10 adults; $5 
for children under 12. To 
reserve a place (or a table 
for 10), please call WHS 
treasurer/secretary Roberta 
Smith: 748-0923 or Ladies’ 
member Carroll Campbell: 
748-3455.
	 Can’t attend, but interest-
ed in making a tax-deduct-
ible financial gift to either 
worthy organization? You 
can send a donation to the:
WHS at P.O. Box 56, Low-
er Waterford, VT 05848 or 
Congregational Church, 
P.O. Box 111, Lower Water-
ford, VT 05848.

	 On Saturday, June 17th at 
1:00 p.m., the Joseph Patch 
Library in Warren welcomes 
Ann McClellan, professor 
and chair of the English De-
partment at Plymouth State 
University, who will present 
(Not So) Elementary, My 
Dear Watson.
	 The recent spate of Sher-
lock Holmes movies, televi-
sion shows, and literary ad-
aptations indicate the Great 
Detective is alive and well in 
the 21st century. Holmes is 
the most portrayed literary 

character of all time, with 
over 230 film versions alone 
in several different languag-
es over the past century, 
Sherlockians created soci-
eties like the Baker Street 
Ir-regulars, wrote articles 
sussing out the ‘sources’ of 
Doyle’s works, and, most re-
cently, developed an entire 
online world of Holmesian 
fan fiction. Sherlock Holmes 
is now a multi-million dollar 
industry. But why? Why is 
Sherlock Holmes so popu-
lar?

 	 This presentation ex-
plores the origins of Arthur 
Conan Doyle’s famous de-
tective and tracks his incar-
nations in literature, film, ad-
vertising, and modern media 
in order to crack the case of 
the most popular detective.
	 Free and open to the pub-
lic, this program promises 
to enlighten and entertain. 
For more information, call 
the Joseph Patch Library at 
764-9072.

Camera! Lights! Oral Histories! Rhubarb!

(Not So) Elementary, My Dear Watson: 
The Popularity of Sherlock Homes

	 Haverhill, NH – The 
Haverhill Historical Society 
has invited Glenn Knoblock 
of Wolfboro Falls, NH to 
present his program “Cov-
ered Bridges of New Hamp-
shire” on Tuesday, June 20 
at 7:00 PM at Alumni Hall, 
75 Court St. in Haverhill Cor-
ner.  Admission is free, open 
to the public and the venue 
is handicapped accessible. 
Prior to the presentation the 
Haverhill Historical Society 
will hold its annual meeting 
beginning at 6:30.
	 Covered wooden bridges 
have been a vital part of the 
New Hampshire transpor-
tation network, dating back 
to the early 1800’s. Given 
New Hampshire’s myriad 
streams, brooks, and rivers, 
it’s not surprising that 400 
covered bridges have been 
documented.  Often viewed 
as quaint relics of a simpler 
past, they were technolog-
ical marvels of their day. 
It may be native ingenui-
ty and New Hampshire’s 
woodworking tradition that 

account for the fact that a 
number of nationally-noted 
covered bridge truss design-
ers were New Hampshire 
natives. Glenn Knoblock 
discusses covered bridge 
design and technology, and 
their designers, builders, 
and associated folklore.
	 Glenn Knoblock is an 
independent scholar and 
author of fifteen books and 
over 100 articles. He is also 
the author and historian on 
projects relating to North-
ern New England bridges, 
New Hampshire cemeteries, 
brewing history, and Afri-
can-American military histo-
ry.  Knoblock has served as 
the main military contributor 
to Harvard and Oxford Uni-
versity’s landmark African 
American Biography Proj-
ect. He holds a BA in History 
from Bowling Green State 
University.
	 For more information, 
contact Roger Warren, 603 
787-2446 or barogw@hot-
mail.com

Haverhill Historical Society’s 
Summer Lecture Series

Gary Goodwin CPT. CGT.
91 Central St. Woodsville, NH. 03785

1-802-243-0100     ggoodwin11@charter.net
Open by appointment week days and weekends.

Certified personal trainer, athletic /assisted stretching
My scope of expertise:

	•	Conditioning	[general	and	specific]	
 • Fitness
 • Post-surgical conditioning
 • Surgical prep./conditioning
	•	Competition	training	[bodybuilding,	figure]
 • Posture training
 • Critical balance, seniors
	•	Athletic	stretching/flexability
	•	Strength	 •	Senior	fitness
 • Core and fundamental trainingGary Goodwin cpt. cgt. 

91 Central St. Woodsville, NH. 03785 

1-603-747-243-0218 

ggoodwin11@charter.net 

Open by appointment week days and weekends. 

Cert. personal trainer, athletic /assisted stretching 

A little bit about what I can do for you and your fitness and wellness. 

I live in Woodsville and have been a lifetime advocate of fitness and 
conditioning. 

I have trained for many years in power lifting and bodybuilding. I 
competed for several years in amateur bodybuilding competitions around 
New England and garnered my share of trophy’s and recognition for my 
efforts. I am a personal and group trainer with many years of knowing 
what and what not to do in training. 

My scope of expertise: 

• Conditioning [general and specific]  

• Fitness 

• Post-surgical conditioning 
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Save Money & Time
A common promise, 
but we deliver!

When you insure your
home and auto with us,
you get:

Substantial discounts on BOTH policies
One stop superior service
Convenient payment options

Call us today to get all the credits you’re eligible for!

Phone 
802-222-4765 

Toll Free Phone 
800-491-4765 

Fax 
802-222-4296 

Due to David’s retirement and the impossibility of replacing him with another who 
has so much dedication knowledge, and experience, the Perry’s Appliance store will 
close at the end of June.

Over the past 40 years, David says he has seen many trends and changes in the 
industry, some of which are repeating right now. “I remember when there were 4-5 
stores in Bradford that sold appliances and another 20 stores in the surrounding area.” 
All of those stores closed their doors succumbing to competition from big box stores 
and the demands of manufacturers who demand large orders and brand exclusivity. 
“That we were able to hold on this long is a testament to the loyalty of our customers 
and our reputation in the community. We were able to carve out a niche by providing 
quick delivery and rapid repair service.” And though David would never say it himself, 
much of the credit belongs to him.

David has earned a well-deserved retirement and is looking forward to spending more time with his family and 
grandchildren. “Sailing has always been my passion so we plan to spend more time cruising along the New England 
coast during the Summer and Fall and then sailing our boat South for the Winter.”

LIQUIDATION SALE
The ENTIRE MONTH of JUNE

PERRY’S APPLIANCE

30-50%
 OFF

173 MAIN STREET BRADFORD

MICROWAVES • STOVES/RANGES
AIR CONDITIONERS • DISHWASHERS

REFRIGERATORS • CLOTHES WASHERS
CLOTHES DRYERS

SAY FAREWELL TO DAVID PERRY
RETIRING AFTER 40 YEARS OF SERVING CUSTOMERS AND OUR COMMUNITY

	 Bradford Conservation 
Commission is pleased to 
announce its award of the 
2017 Friends of Wrights 
MT Scholarship to Oxbow 
High School Senior, Natalie 
Barton of Bradford.  Eligi-
bility requirements for this 
$500 scholarship include 
evidence of community ser-
vice, including the school 
and greater Bradford envi-
ronment and pursuit of stud-
ies related to protecting our 
Natural Resources.
	 Natalie met all those re-
quirements and more.  At 
Oxbow, she developed a 
grant application and re-
ceived $3,500 in funding to 
plant apple trees and blue-
berry and raspberry bushes 
on campus, after selecting 
suitable sites for each vari-
ety.  Getting approvals from 
the Oxbow Buildings and 

Grounds Committee, Admin-
istration and School Board 
helped Natalie to engage in 
the process of a community 
endeavor.
	 Looking into the future, 
Natalie conceived the idea 
of engaging local 5th grad-
ers in the project with Ox-

bow 10th graders.  Providing 
instruction in proper plant-
ing, Natalie’s well-trained 
captains organized the el-
ementary school students 
who completed the planting 
together.  It was her long-
range vision that when the 
5th graders reached 10th 
grade, they would be har-
vesting the fruits of their la-
bor.
	 The Friends of Wrights 
MT Scholarship is awarded 
each year to an Oxbow Se-
nior who resides in Bradford 
and plans to pursue further 
studies related to the envi-
ronment. The scholarship 
is seeded each year from 
the proceeds of the Brad-
ford Conservation Commis-
sion’s Annual Race to the 
Top, which is a National 
Trails Day Event held in the 
Wrights Mountain/Devil’s 
Den Town Forest.

BCC Scholarship Winner

Colorful Annuals & Hanging BasketsColorful Annuals & Hanging Baskets
Herbs & PerennialsHerbs & Perennials

20% O20% Offff TTReesRees, e, eveRgReeNsveRgReeNs
& f& flOweRiNglOweRiNg ssHRuBsHRuBs

Rte. 10; 
Orford, NH

(603) 
353-9901

Monday - Saturday 8:00-5:00;  Sunday 10:00-4:00

www.millgardensfarmstand.com

Pottery
25% 
oFF 

New & Reliable Motors 
ON ALL THREE PONTON BOATS

Enjoy the River Valley 
from a Unique Angle

Enjoy the Beautiful Connecticut River
         From the Comfort of a 
                        Pontoon Boat

Rental Fee starts at $75
Half Day & Full Day Rentals Available

Contact Byron at The Pastures Campground
Call 603-353-4579 or www.thepastures.com
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www.perryoil.com | 800-654-3344 | Contact us for details!

FREE PROPANE OR FUEL OIL SERVICE

Get up to 250 gallons FREE when you start new propane service with us. 

We will split the bill on your first fill based on tank size up to 500 gallons.

FREE annual oil cleaning and inspection when you setup a new 

automatic delivery account with us.  A $159 value!

Customers must remain on automatic delivery with a 1 year supply agreement for fuel. One year lock-in price rates available.

Not valid with any other offer. You must be at least 18 years old to 
purchase fireworks.  Check with the local fire dept or town officials 
regarding fireworks permits in your community. 

E. Montpelier
VT Route 14S
802.229.9659

St. Johnsbury
1306 Memorial Dr.

802.424.1530

Fairlee
404 Route 5

802.333.3033

OUR STORES ARE OPEN DAILY FROM 9am - 8pm! 

FREE FIREWORKS!

PLUS INSTANT REWARDS

THRU JUNE 26 ONLY!

Spend $100 - $149 choose 1 item valued at $19.99
Spend $150 - $249, choose 1 item valued at $49.99 
Spend $250 - $499, choose 1 item valued at $89.99
Spend $500 - $749, choose 1 item valued at $150

Spend $750 - $1000, choose 1 item from each tier! 

Giveaway items may vary day to day based on availability. 
Visit stores early for the best Instant Rewards selection!

BUY ONE
GET ONE

FREE!

northstarfireworks.com

 SPECIALTY PROGRAMS: 
Hiking & Camping * Sewing 
Painting * Jewelry Making  
         Outdoor Survival 

Golf * Cooking * Frisbee Golf 
Archery * Gardening * Games 
Arts & Crafts * Science Fun  

  Weekly Swim Lessons & Open Swim Sessions  

To register, contact Katie @ 603-838-5954   

Great 

Deal! 
 $120 Weekly Membership  

Fee includes: Field Trips & Swim Lessons 
Daily Rate Available  

  2017  
 SUMMER CAMP 
 June 19 - August 18 

The G. Hampton McGaw 
Chapter of the National Hon-
or Society (NHS) at Woods-
ville High School held a car 
wash on Saturday, May 27th 
at Woodsville Elementa-
ry School. The organization 
raised over $800 for the Na-
tional Honor Society Schol-
arship Fund. Each year, the 
group awards 1-4 NHS Com-
munity Scholarships and 1-2 
NHS Appreciation Awards. 

Hot Dogs - Cold Drinks - Ice Cream
Buddy THE Clown  
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UNIQUE MADE IN VERMONT, hand crafted gifts 
for your Graduate and Dad. We also have Home, 
Patio, Bar & Wedding Decor. The Rusty Buck-
et 37 Depot St. Lyndonville, VT. 802/745-8695    
therustybucket.net	 06.13

LIGHTWEIGHT BOAT DOCKS. 1 person can in-
stall or take them out. In stock. Standing, floating, 
or roll-in. Fairlee Marine, see them on our website 
www.fairleemarine.com 802-333- 9745     08.22

NEW BOAT PACKAGES are here. We carry Ava-
lon Pontoons, Polarkraft aluminum, & Carolina 
Skiff fiberglass boats. With Mercury or Honda 
motors. Fairlee Marine 802-333-9745	 08.22

PUSH LAWNMOWERS: several to choose from. 
Also front tine rototillers. 603-823-0018	 06.13

LYNN EXTENSION LADDER (28’ extended). 
Class 1A (300 lbs.) Fiberglass & aluminum, still 
in great  condition but well used. $125. 603-747-
2269 after 5 pm. Ask for Charlie	 06.27

BUNK BEDS: 2 Sets, Excellent condition. Twin 
on full. Cherry finish. Mattress included. $500/set 
or BO. Call 508-728-6313 in Lincoln, NH. 	06.27

STANDING SEAM ROOFING MATERIALS: 
Complete materials pkg for a 1200 sqft chalet 
roof.  38-20’ gray Everseam panels with all hard-
ware and ridgecap.  $4000 or b/o. 603-787-2414	
	 06.27

RECORD PLAYER: Magnavox Console, 10 re-
cords at a time. 17” x 25” high x 36” wide. Maple, 
good condition. $50. Call 603-787-6879	 06.27

1995 CHEVROLET PRIZM & 1997 Toyota Coro-
la, $500 each. 603-272-4903	 6.27

ROLL NICKELS, 1939-49, $12. Roll Buffalo 
nickels, 1913-1938, $99. Indian Head cents, 
1881-1908 (19) coins, $49. WWII Silver nickels, 
1942-45 (7) coins, $16. Liberty Head “V” nickels, 
1895-1912 (19) coins, $30. Susan B. anthony 
proof 1980-S, $8. 802-439-3254	 06.27

CERTIFIED USED BOATS. Lots of good used 
boats to choose from. Checked over by our certi-
fied technicians. If it’s not reliable, we won’t sell it. 
Fairlee Marine, see them on our website at www.
fairleemarine.com 802-333-9745      	 08.22

Personal: For Sale, Wanted, Lost, Found: Up to 30 words FREE for 2 issues. ($10,000 value limit)
Business: Help Wanted, For Rent, etc. $10/2 issues, $20/5 issues, $50/15 issues. Limit of 30 words.
Classifieds that exceed word count may be subject to an additional charge. 
Mail or Drop Off at Trendy Times, 171 Central Street, Woodsville, NH  03785 Email: Gary@trendytimes.com

We Accept Cash, Check or Credit/Debit Cards

REIKI RETREAT: Barbara L. Smith RMT, LMT. 
Reiki sessions & classes. 10 years experience. 
Offering Massage, Biofield Tuning and Zero Bal-
ancing. Gift certificates available. 90 Farm St, 
East Ryegate, VT. 802-757-2809. reikiretreat@
charter.net or check the website www.vtreikire-
treat.com

INSTRUMENT LESSONS: Offering private pia-
no, guitar, banjo & clarinet lessons for beginner 
& intermediate students of all ages. 30+ years in-
structing. Call 603-398-7272.	 10.03

Step by Step School of Dance Summer Dance 
Camp classes at Live A Little Fitness, Lincoln. 6 
Week sessions beginning July 11 & 12. Classes 
for Toddlers to Adults. Call 603-991-3387	 06.27

CONSIGNMENTS: We take good late mod-
el boats in to sell for you. We do the sale and 
warranty, you collect the cash. They sell fast and 
you get as much or more than selling it yourself. 
Fairlee Marine, see them on our website at www.
fairleemarine.com 802-333-9745 	 08.22

Will buy one item or complete households. Al-
ways buying US coins. Route 5 Collectibles, 277 
Main Street, Lyndonville 802-626-5430

HANDYMAN, CARPENTRY, DECKS, stairs, 
painting, cut lawns, interior and exterior doors, 
trim and remodeling. Call if you need anything. 
Luke Lucas 603-787-6479, leave mesage	09.05

DELIVERY CREW/TENT INSTALLERS wanted 
for the season.  Looking for motivated individuals 
for 40+ hours a week to join our team-oriented 
Party Rental Company.   Competitive wages of-
fered with training from experienced staff. Apply 
in Person only at 502 Union St., Littleton - Abbott 
Rental & Party Store.	 06.27

BOAT SERVICE: Is your boat unreliable and ready 
to go? Doesn’t have the power it used to? Our 
Certified Technicians fix things right. We can wa-
ter test or dyno test so you know it’s fixed. Fairlee 
Marine www.fairleemarine.com 802-333- 9745 	
	 08.22

CLEAN OUT SERVICE: Estates, Home, Attic, 
Basement, Barn, Storage Units, Foreclosures.
We specialize in homes filled by a lifetime of col-
lecting! Low Rates / FREE ! I  BUY items too! We 
recycle and donate! Serving Vermont and New 
Hampshire. Call or text Ron at 802-279-9742
	 07.25

6’ MALE, BLONDE, BLUE EYES, like long drives, 
looking for long term releationship with female. 
Please call 802-454-7824	 05.30

BOAT RENTALS, Pontoon, Canoes, Kayaks, 
Runabout ski boats. Daily and weekly rentals. We 
launch and pick up. Fairlee Marine www.fairlee-
marine.com 802-333-9745 	 08.22

WELLS RIVER, VT HOUSING AVAILABLE: *51 
Main Street:2 BD apartment available now.  $700 
rent includes electric, heat, trash and snow re-
moval. Walking distance to banks, stores and 
laundromat.  Income restrictions apply.  Security 
Deposit payment plan available!  To request an
application, call Shelly at 775-1100 Ext. #7, e-mail 
[shelly@epmanagement.com ]( mailto:shelly@
epmanagement.com ) or visit [http://epmanage-
ment.com/vermont-properties/ ] (http://epman-
agement.com/vermont-properties/ ) to print an 
application. E.H.O.	 07.25

WELLS RIVER HOUSING: Commercial/Office 
space: 323 Sq. Ft. Commercial Space available 
at 51 Main Street in Downtown Wells River, VT. 
$300 rent includes all utilities.   Walking distance 
to banks, stores and laundromat.  For further de-
tails please contact Shelly at E.P. Management 
Corp. 802-775-1100 Ext. #7 or e-mail shelly@ep-
management.com. E.H.O.	 07.25

CLASSIFIED FORM
We accept checks, credit/debit cards 

and even cash!
MAIL OR DROP OFF AT:

171 Central Street, Woodsville, NH  03785
EMAIL: gary@trendytimes.com

q For Sale q For Rent q Lost
q Help Wanted q Free q Found
q Personals q Wanted
q Other ______________
Description: ________________________
__________________________________
__________________________________ 
__________________________________
__________________________________
Price: _____________________________
Phone Number: _____________________

NON-BusINEss: For Sale, Wanted, Lost,
Found: Up to 30 words FREE for 2 issues.
($10,000 value limit)
BusINEss: Help Wanted, For Rent, etc.
$10/2 issues, $20/5 issues, $50/16 issues.
Limit of 30 words.

Classifieds that exceed word count 
may be subject to an additional charge. 

Mail or Drop Off at Trendy Times, 
171 Central Street, Woodsville, NH  03785

Email: Gary@trendytimes.com  
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SARANAC STREET 
ANTIQUES

141 Main Street, Littleton, NH
603-444-4888

Closed Monday & Tuesday

 

 

 

Gilman Senior Housing 
Gilman, Vermont 

Currently Building Waitlists for 
Studio & One Bedroom Apartments 

Housing for elderly and/or disabled households 

 Rent Based on Income 
 All Utilities Included 
 On-Site Mail Delivery 
 On-Site Laundry 
 Off-Street Parking 
 Households with extremely low income 

may receive preference in placement  
based on HUD guidelines 

Application, Background Checks,  
Landlord References Required 

Stop by or Call for an Application Today! 
(802) 535-3555 Ext: 1209 

TTY: (800) 253-0191 

 

 

 

 

 

EMAILED ADVERTISEMENT

ADVERTISING INSERTION ORDER
Thomas Hirchak Company
Phone: 800-634-7653
From: Terra Keene
Email: Advertising2@THCAuction.com

TO: Gary
PHONE: 603-747-2887
COMPANY: Trendy Times

TODAY’S DATE: 06/08/17
NAME OF FILE: VEH_TT
DATE(S) TO RUN: 6/13/17
SIZE OF AD: 2x4
1C=2”

EMAILED TO: gary@trendytimes.com

150± Repos, Trades, Donations & More!!

Thomas Hirchak Co. • THCAuction.com • 800-474-6132 • (NH#2661)

’06 Dodge GR Caravan
’06 Ford Escape
’06 Ford F-150
’06 Ford Focus
’06 Ford Fusion
’06 Honda Civic
’06 Volvo XC90
’05 Chevy Aveo
’05 Chevy Silverado
’05 Dodge Caravan
’05 Ford F-250 SD
’05 Ford Focus ZX3

’05 Ford Freestar
’05 Ford Freestyle
’05 Ford Taurus
’05 GMC Envoy
’05 Honda Odyssey
’05 Hyundai Elantra
’05 Jeep GR Cherokee
’05 Mercury Sable
’05 Subaru Legacy
’05 Toyota Camry Solara
’05 Toyota Highlander
’05 VW Jetta

’04 Audi A6
’04 Chevy Impala
’04 Ford F-150
’04 Hyundai Sonata
’04 Jeep GR Cherokee
’04 Nissan Pathfinder
’04 Subaru Forester
’04 Subaru Impreza
’04 Volvo S60 R
’04 Volvo XC70

& MORE! 
Subject to Change

Wednesday, June 14 @ 5:30PM (Register @ 3:30PM)
298 J Brown Dr., Williston, VT

	 North Haverhill, NH   
Dawn Irene Langley, 69, 
died on Tuesday, June 6, 
2017, at Cottage Hospital, 
Woodsville, NH. 
	 Dawn was born in Boston, 
MA, on October 11, 1947 to 
Robert Bruce and Vivian 
(Brown) McLeod.  She grad-
uated from Jamaica Plain 
High School in 1965 and at-
tended Boston University.  
	 Dawn was a librarian 
at the Woodsville Free Li-
brary for 25 years, retiring in 
June of 2016.  Locally, she 
also worked at Lost River, 
the Grafton County Nursing 
Home, and at Ski Monteau 
in Mt. Lakes. 
	 Dawn moved to the area 
from Attleboro, MA, in 1985.  
She had attended the Meth-
odist Church.  Dawn had a 
love of books and of reading 
and shared this love with her 
library patrons. She enjoyed 
gambling trips to casinos 
with her son, Mike, and her 
friends. She played comput-
er puzzle games, enjoyed 
watching her television pro-
grams, and was a fan of Am-
azon. Dawn cared for a va-
riety of pets over the years.  
She always enjoyed a good 
meal out with friends. She 
was proud to achieve 31 
years of sobriety with AA.  
	 She was predeceased by 
her husband, Walter Lang-
ley, a Mansfield, MA, police 
officer, killed in the line of 
duty on October 2, 1983.  
She was also predeceased 
by her longtime companion, 
Bruce L. Newton, on March 
25, 2017. 
	

She is survived by two sons, 
Jeffrey Simpson of North 
Haverhill and Michael Simp-
son of Woodsville; a grand-
son, Seth Simpson of Gresh-
am, OR; a sister, Kathy 
Houpt and husband Joe of 
Palacious, TX; a nephew, 
Robert Houpt of Pensacola, 
FL; and aunt, Verna Barber 
of Concord, NH; along with 
several cousins and dear 
friends. 
	 There will be no calling 
hours. 
	 A celebration of Dawn’s 
life will be held at the home 
of her son, Mike Simpson, 
at 19 Cherry Street, Woods-
ville, on Saturday, June 24, 
from 12-2 PM. 
	 Memorial contributions 
may be made to Cottage 
Hospital, Med-Surg Depart-
ment, PO Box 2001, Woods-
ville, NH 03785.
	 For more information or 
to offer an online condo-
lence, please visit www.rick-
erfh.com
	 Ricker Funeral Home & 
Cremation Care of Woods-
ville is in charge of arrange-
ments. 

 Dawn Irene Langley - OBITUARY

	 Bradford, Vermont - Da-
vid Perry, manager of the 
Perry’s Oil Appliance Store 
in Bradford is retiring after 40 
years with Perry’s Oil. Due 
to David’s retirement and 
the impossibility of replacing 
him with another who has so 
much dedication knowledge, 
and experience, the Perry’s 
Appliance store will close at 
the end of June.
	 David’s history in the 
business and the commu-
nity goes back over four 
decades. Having added 
propane delivery to their 
growing fuel oil business in 
the 1950’s, the Perry family 
realized that the fastest way 
to get more customers using 
propane was to sell custom-
ers propane fueled appli-
ances. The business grew 
and in 1961 they bought the 
Union Block building and 
shared space with Central 
Vermont Public Service. Gas 
appliances were sold on one 
side of the building by Per-
ry’s and electric appliances 
were sold on the other by 
the electric utility. In 1972, 
CVPS moved out and Per-
ry’s expanded again to cre-
ate showroom space, selling 
all types of appliances.
	 David joined the busi-
ness as a teenager in 1977. 
“I started as a helper in the 
service department and then 
I drove delivery fuel trucks 
for a couple of years,” says 
David. “During the early 
1980s I managed the parts 
department and in 1985 we 
followed the trends to start 
selling TVs and satellite an-
tennas. That market grew 
and so did my role so that 
when my parents reached 
retirement at the end of the 
decade, I took over with run-
ning the appliance end of 

the business.”
	 Over the past 40 years, 
David says he has seen 
many trends and changes in 
the industry, some of which 
are repeating right now. “I 
remember when there were 
4-5 stores in Bradford that 
sold appliances and an-
other 20 stores in the sur-
rounding area.” All of those 
stores closed their doors 
succumbing to competition 
from big box stores and the 
demands of manufactur-
ers who demand large or-
ders and brand exclusivity. 
“That we were able to hold 
on this long is a testament 
to the loyalty of our custom-
ers and our reputation in the 
community. We were able to 
carve out a niche by provid-
ing quick delivery and rapid 
repair service.” And though 

David would never say it 
himself, much of the credit 
belongs to him.
	 David has earned a 
well-deserved retirement 
and is looking forward to 
spending more time with his 
family and grandchildren. 
“Sailing has always been my 
passion so we plan to spend 
more time cruising along the 
New England coast during 
the Summer and Fall and 
then sailing our boat South 
for the Winter.”
	 As we say farewell to 
David we are also working 
to liquidate the remaining 
inventory in our store and 
warehouse. So come on 
by to say goodbye to David 
and also take advantage of 
deep discounts on a variety 
of home appliances.

David Perry to Retire After 40 Years 
in the Appliance Business
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	 Father’s Day is almost here. 
Dad will probably like any gift you 
give him, of course, but this year, 
why not go beyond the ordinary? 
By presenting your father with an 
appropriate financial gift, you can 
bring him some benefits that can 
keep on giving.
 	 For starters, how about a back-
to-school gift for Dad? If you have 
children, you may already be fa-
miliar with 529 plans, which many 
parents use to help their children 
pay for college. But 529 plans 
have no age limits, so there’s 
nothing stopping you from revers-
ing the usual formula and opening 
an account for your father. While 
529 plans are commonly used 
to pay for four-year colleges, the 
money can also go toward most 
two-year community colleges 
and trade schools, so if Dad has 
a future interest in learning about 
anything from anthropology to 
auto repair, the 529 plan you’ve 
established can give him the gift 
of knowledge and enjoyment.

 	 As the own-
er of a 529 plan, 
your earnings 
can accumulate 
tax free, provid-
ed they are used 
for qualified high-
er education ex-

penses. (529 plan distributions not 
used for qualified expenses may 
be subject to federal and state in-
come tax, and a 10% IRS penalty 
on the earnings.) Furthermore, if 
you invest in your own state’s 529 
plan, you might be able to deduct 
the contributions from your taxes.
 	 Here’s another suggestion: 
Help Dad reach a distant goal. For 
example, if you know your father 
will be retiring in, say, 10 years, 
you could give him some type of 
bond that matures just when he 
retires. During those 10 years, he 
will receive regular semiannual 
interest payments, and when the 
bond matures, he’ll get the origi-
nal principal back. He can then 
use this money to help fulfill a 
long-held dream – perhaps one of 
traveling the world or even open-
ing a small business. Whatever 
he decides to do with the money, 
it will make a nice retirement gift.
 	 If you’re giving Dad a corporate 
bond, make sure it’s “investment 
grade,” which means it has re-
ceived one of the highest ratings 
for safety from one of the major 
bond-rating agencies. Invest-
ment-grade bonds are generally 
the least likely to default. If your 
father is in one of the upper tax 
brackets, he might benefit from 
a municipal bond, whose interest 

payments are exempt from fed-
eral income taxes and possibly 
state and local taxes, too. (Some 
municipal bonds, however, are 
subject to the alternative mini-
mum tax.)
 	 Finally, you may want to help 
Dad plan his legacy. Although 
your father may be interested in 
what sort of legacy he will leave, 
he may not yet have taken any 
steps in this area – in particular, 
he might not have created a com-
prehensive estate plan.
 	 You might consider giving your 
father some resources on estate 
planning, such as books or online 
articles. Better yet, though, con-
sider setting him up with a con-
sultation with a legal profession-
al. It will take considerable time 
and effort to create the necessary 
documents, such as a will, a living 
trust, a durable power of attorney, 
and so on – and since the future 
is not ours to see, it’s best to take 
care of these tasks sooner, rather 
than later.
 	 Father’s Day is just a blip on 
the calendar. But by giving Dad 
some valuable financial gifts, you 
can help brighten all his days.
 	 This article was written by Ed-
ward Jones for use by your local Ed-
ward Jones Financial Advisor.

Financial Gifts Can Help Dad for Years to Come

Sean Kelly
Professional Tool Sharpener

A ShArp EdgE 
Bradford, VT  05033
Knives & Scissors

Professional Beauty Shears
Barber & Grooming Shears

Many Garden Tools
Phone: 802-222-9258
(Call now for brochure)

“Put A Razor Sharp

Edge On Your Tools”

by Maggie Anderson

 The Vintage Voyagers 
writers group meets at the 
Horse Meadow Senior Cen-
ter in North Haverhill every 
Wednesday at 10:30 AM. 
I’m happy to say that when I 
wandered in one day sever-
al years ago they let me stay, 
allowed me to contribute to 
the conversation and, when 
the meeting closed just be-
fore lunch was served, I’m 
happy to report that not one 
of them told me never to 
darken their door again.
 	 I enjoy it so much I ac-
tually changed one of my 
work days in order to contin-
ue to join them on as many 
Wednesdays as possible. 
I’m not comparing them to 
cats that become family af-
ter having them around for 
a long time but I do see the 
Vintage Voyagers as ex-
tended family which is sort 
of strange because with 
six brothers already I really 
didn’t need any more when I 
wandered in that first day.
 	 It is an unusual group, 
the numbers roll with the 
tides of the seasons, various 
surgeries and crazy work 
schedules. The core group 
is made up of unique per-

sonalities and backgrounds 
and occasionally a writer 
who does not have to resort 
to a bottle to hide their gray-
ing hair stops in.
 	 There are several teach-
ers in the mix and when 
Summer looms we often find 
ourselves discussing some 
of our own favorite teachers. 
We do dip a toe into the bad 
teacher pool now and then 
but that water’s not very 
comfortable and the deep 
dive hasn’t happened too 
many times.
 	 Yesterday with the beau-
tiful Spring weather and all 
the talk of graduations near 
and far I found myself think-
ing about my fourth grade 
teacher. My fondest mem-
ories of school and its re-
quirements were the teach-
ers who without warning 
would stray from the script 
and have everybody haul 
their little bodies outside to 
paint in the fresh air, to learn 
something about the flowers 
that were blooming beneath 
their feet or the insects al-
ready busy gathering next 
season’s food and tending 
this season’s brood.
 	 There were days when if 
you happened to pass the 
schoolyard Mrs. Crossley’s 

fourth graders would be ly-
ing on their backs watch-
ing the sky and listening to 
her description of the cloud 
formations or the birds 
that skimmed beneath the 
clouds. We were enchanted 
not only by Mrs. Crossley’s 
lecture but also the cama-
raderie of her willingness to 
lie down in the grass with us 
and share what she knew.
 	 There are teachers and 
then there are teachers. 
Mrs. Crossley was a star 
among them. We loved her 
because in many ways we 
felt she was one of us, only 
smarter, or at least she knew 
stuff we didn’t know until she 
came into our lives.
 	 The first time Hank and I 
came to New Hampshire for 
a vacation I tried to find Mrs. 
Crossley. I wanted to tell her 
how important she had been 
to me, how many things I 
paid attention to because 
she impressed upon us their 
importance and the fleeting 
nature of their existence.
 	 I wanted to tell her that 
Hank and I had often tak-
en our children to some 
spot just to see what nature 
was up to at that moment. I 
wanted her to know that we 
talked about her whenever 
we did the unexpected. But 
when I checked in at my old 
school sadly I found Mrs. 
Crossley had graduated to 
an upper classroom and I 
never got to thank her.
 	 So here’s to Mrs. Cross-
ley and others like her who 
found a way to reach us and 
made the search an adven-
ture. I thank you all.

Ode To Mrs. Crossley
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By Marianne L. Kelly
	 So. Ryegate, VT—Final-
ly, after a cool, wet Spring, 
the warm sunny weather we 
have all be waiting for has 
arrived...for the moment.
	 At My Farmers Market 
this means a continuous 
march of seasonal vegeta-
bles and flowering plants. As 
of this writing we have as-
paragus, onions, parsnips, 
lettuce mixes, spinach, bok 
choy, sprouts, radishes and 
whatever else is ready for 
our shelves, with more com-
ing. Owner Jennifer Bone 
says the peas are looking 
good! We recently received 
a nice supply of locally 
grown rhubarb.
	 With summer om the 
horizon, we leave our din-
ing room tables and move 
to more casual outdoor en-
tertaining. Our food vendors 
are looking forward to help-
ing you be a guest at all your 
parties and events, by offer-
ing a variety of salads, finger 
foods that include Quiche 
bites, Spanikopita triangles, 
and appetizers, as well as 
bread, rolls, cookies, pas-
tries, cheesecakes, and ev-
eryone’s favorite...pie.
	 We are working on a 
summer menu of sugges-
tions. Just ask if you don’t 
see what you want. We 
will also be well stocked at 
the market with prepared 
meals and more, so stop in 
and check us out. Order on 
Tuesday and pick up on Fri-
day or Saturday.
	 Take advantage of our 
knife, scissors, and small 
garden tools sharpening 
service. Drop your job off on 
Thursday from 9-12 and pick 

it them up either on Satur-
day, the following Thursday 
morning, or by convenient 
arrangement. You can also 
drop them off at other times. 
Marianne is on duty each 
Thursday and can answer 
your questions. A brochure 
is available at the market.
	 Mark your calendars and 
bring your family and friends 
to our second annual straw-
berry festival on June 24, 
where we will be serving 
strawberry shortcake from 
11-2.
	 Does anyone know if fair-
ies like strawberries? Gen-
evieve Bone believes they 
do. She is building a fairy 
village complete with fairy 
mushroom stools, gourds, 
bird houses, colorful stones, 
sticks and shells to welcome 
these whimsical creatures 
should they decide to visit. 
“Nothing plastic,” said Gen-
evieve. “Everything must be 
of the natural world, just like 

the fairies.”
	 What?! You don’t believe 
in fairies? Don’t tell that to 
Genevieve. We’re not going 
to try to convince you either 
way.
	 After you’ve eaten your 
strawberry shortcake, follow 
the magic path behind the 
market to the babbling brook 
where Genevieve will wel-
come you, and see for your-
self. 
	 Oh yes, don’t forget to 
bring some strawberries 
with you...just in case...you 
never can tell with fairies. 
	 My Farmers Market is lo-
cated on Creamery Rd. off 
Rte. 302 in So. Ryegate. Fol-
low the bright yellow flags.
	 Hours are 9-6 Tues-
day-Sat.  11-2 Sun. Closed 
on Monday
	 Visit our Facebook page 
and visit our web site: www.
myfarmersmarket.com
	 See you at My Farmers 
Market!

News From My Farmers Market Card of Thanks
 The family of Adam J. Ward would like to sin-
cerely thank everyone for the acts of kindness and sym-
pathy: food, cards, flowers, donations to North Country 
Longspurs, memories shared, and your loving support 
and prayers.
          Also, a special thank you to Bryan, Melissa and 
Tom at Ricker Funeral Home for being so caring and 
helpful at this most difficult time.

          Adam will always be remembered for his warm 
smile and kind manner.

 Thank You,
 Ted and Fey Ward
 Ashley and Dan Chauvin

 Autumn and Todd Makela
 And Family
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FRANCONIA
Max Market
Woodsville Guaranty
Franconia General 

Store

HAVERHILL
Lavoie’s Auto Care
Joan’s Hair Design

LINCOLN
Goodie's Mobil
McDonald's 
Tedeski Convenience
Price Chopper
Village Mall

LISBON
Du-Ez Lisbon
Northrop's
Sunoco
Woodsville Guaranty

LITTLETON
Littleton Mobil
Littleton Coop
Littleton Diner
Shaw's
Topic Of The Town
Woodsville Guaranty
(Cottage St & Meadow St.)

MONROE
That Dam Pit Stop

NORTH HAVERHILL 
Aldrich General Store
DMS
Hatchland Store
Haverhill Town Office
Horse Meadow Senior
PT Farm
Patten's Gas

ORFORD
Cheap Kids
Patterson's
Peyton Place

PIERMONT 
Piermont 4 Corners
Robie Farm
Woodsville Guaranty

SUGAR HILL
Harman Cheese
Polly’s Pancake Parlor

WARREN
Burning Bush
Tedeski Convenience

WENTWORTH
Shawnee's Gen.Store

WOODSTOCK
Cascade Coffee House
Fadden's Gen.Store
Peg's Breakfast/Lunch
Truants Restaurant
Wayne's Deli & Meat
Woodstock Inn

WOODSVILLE
Bank of NH
Cumberland Farms
D&P's
Dunkin’ Donuts
McDonald's
Shiloh's
Shaw's
Trendy Threads
Village Pizza
Woodsville Guaranty

BARNET
Barnet Village Store
Paul's Whistle Stop (McIndoes)
West Barnet Quick Stop

BRADFORD
Bliss Market
Bradford 4 Corners
Hannaford's
Kinney Drugs
Safe Ship

DANVILLE
Hastings Store
Marty's Quick Stop

EAST CORINTH
General Store

FAIRLEE
Chapman's
Cumberland Farms
Lake Morey Inn
Wing's

GROTON
Upper Valley Grill

LYNDONVILLE
Cumberland Farms
Lyndon Buffet
White's Market Main St.
White's Shopping Plaza

NEWBURY
Newbury Village Store

SOUTH RYEGATE
My Farmers Market

ST. JOHNSBURY
Anthony’s Diner
Dunkin’ Donuts
Green Mt. Mall
Kingdom Crust
Kinney Drugs
PettyCo Junction
Price Chopper
Saint J Brewery
White’s Market

W. TOPSHAM
Gramps Country Store

WELLS RIVER
Big Bubbles
Copies & More
P&H Truckstop
The River’s Edge

Eatery

1
2
3

4
57

8
9
10

11 12

171 Central Street • Woodsville, NH 03785
Phone: 603-747-2887 • Fax: 603-747-2889

Email: gary@trendytimes.com
Website: www.trendytimes.com6
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VERMONT

NEW HAMPSHIRETOTAL DISTRIBUTION 8,000+
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Or check out www.trendytimes.com 
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by Elinor Mawson
	 It has been some years 
now since our trip to China 
but there are some things 
that seem like they hap-
pened yesterday. Going 
to the Great Wall is one of 
them.
	 Our China trip was 
planned for several years 
with  Yige and Nora, with 
whom we had become 
friends. Yige had been work-
ing in my classroom as as 
an ESL (English as a second 
language) person as I had 
several students who need-
ed  his help and support. 
He was also working on his 
second  Master’s degree at 
UNH and gave me his pa-
pers to edit before he turned 
them in. I often say I learned 
more about English doing 
this job than I had learned in 
college! 
	 So it was with Yige and his 
wife Nora that we planned 
our trip and one July day we 
got on a plane for our trip of 
a lifetime. They had flown 
from east to west; we took 
a different airline and flew 
from west to east. We were 
to meet in Shanghai, which 
we did. Then we took a train 
with them to their home city. 
Nora stayed with her par-
ents and Yige accompanied 
us to Beijing (a long story 
which will have to wait until 
another column).
	 It was decided to take 
the trip to the Great Wall in 
a taxi. It was about 50 miles 
away but Yige told us it was 
the easiest and most cost-ef-
fective way to go. I know it 
was more comfortable than 
a tour bus or other contriv-
ance to get to our destina-
tion.
	 I don’t know what I ex-
pected to see, but when we 
got there the first sight was 
a large flea-market atmo-
sphere--dozens of booths 
selling all sorts of souvenirs, 
clothing, you name it. And 
dozens of people shouting 
at us--”You buy Missy?” We 
ignored them all--except for 
a man selling plastic rain 
ponchos--for it had begun to 
rain.
	 Yige led us to a gondola 
which took us up to the wall. 
We probably could have 
climbed our way up, but this 
was easier. On our way, we 
saw a man selling camel 
rides!  
	 The place was crowded 
with mostly Chinese tourists. 
Every so often we would 
hear someone speaking En-
glish --and it was always a 
complaint--”I’m frozen!” or 
“Did you ever see so many 
people in your life?”  We 
thought  “How could you 

complain when you are on 
the Great Wall of China?”
	 We walked and walked. 
The surface was slate and 
could be slippery, but for-
tunately there were sturdy 
handrails and we took ad-
vantage of them.  Most of 
the way was steep because 
the wall is built on top of the 
mountains. We looked at 
the landscape which was 
hilly, and since it was rain-
ing, there were clouds hang-
ing on to the sides  of the 
hills.  Up at the top of one 
steep grade was a souve-
nir stand!  I have to say we 
were amazed at  that.
	 Yige took a lot of pictures 
of us.  Today I must admit I 
wish it wasn’t raining since 
all of the pictures show us 
looking bedraggled  in our 
pink polka-dotted  ponchos! 
	 We must have been there 
a couple of hours. Every so 
often we would stop and ex-
claim how wonderful it was 
to be there. But everything 
must end and we took the 
gondola back down to the 
parking lot.  We succumbed 
to a couple of souvenirs--like 
a Chinese vest and some lit-
tle suits for our grandsons 
which said “I climbed the 
Great Wall”.  
	 On the way back to Bei-
jing we stopped for lunch, 
and when we got the check 
we found that we had to pay 
for our taxi driver’s lunch as 
well.  Apparently that is a 
Chinese custom. 
	 A couple of days later we 
took another taxi back to the 
Ming Tombs and also to a 
garden type place featuring 
huge stone animals. They 
were both interesting and 
wonderful. But they were 
nothing like our trip to the 
Great Wall of China.

The Great Wall Do We Need To Get A Lifeline?
by Kellie Quackenbush

	 I was visiting a friend not 
so long ago, and they were 
telling me of the problems 
the older couple that lived 
across the street from them 
had been having. The hus-
band, in his 90’s had some 
memory issues. On several 
occasions, when the wife 
would go out to get the mail, 
the husband would lock the 
door behind her, she then 
would be locked out of the 
house. She would beat on 
the door and yell for her hus-
band but he would not open 
the door. My friend said they 
would hear her and they 
would call the husband and 
tell him to open the door.
	 Another friend had told 
me of the plight of their par-
ents. Retired farmers that 
had at one point known the 
names of everyone that 
lived in their town. Now the 
mother and father live alone 
in a small house in the coun-
try. Recently the father has 
been having falls. There is 
no cellular phone service 
where they live. Recent-
ly, the father has had falls 
outside while walking alone 
and been unable to get up. 
The sadness, in my friend’s 
voice, easily understood as 
the horror of the incident 
was retold. How cold it was 
and how long the father had 
been stuck laying on the 
ground, hoping someone 
would find him.
	 This winter, a man had 
gone to get his mail from the 
mail-box. Walking from his 
house down the driveway to 
get his mail, a task he had 
done thousands of times 
before. He slipped on the 
snowy drive and broke his 
hip. Without a phone, he lay 
on the ground for an untold 
length of time until someone 

noticed him on the ground in 
the middle of his driveway. 
It was too late, he had died 
from the elements.
	 Thinking about the above 
examples, which are all true 
examples, it is easy to say 
they clearly needed a lifeline 
or one of the many safety 
alert systems that are now 
available. Why did these 
people not have such a sys-
tem? That is the issue. We 
all have seen the advertise-
ment, “Help, I’ve fallen and 
I can’t get up.” Some of us 
laugh, others grimace but 
nobody wants to ever think 
they would ever be in such a 
situation.
	 It is difficult to imagine 
how moving through our 
lives as strong independent 
people, one day we become 
weak and need help. It starts 
with an injury or sometimes 
an illness, we shake it off as 
we recover but continue ag-
ing. Pride moves us forward, 
we won’t be that woman on 
the TV ad, we can get up.
	 As time goes by, it is the 
little changes that often go 
unnoticed that add up to 
limited movement or frail 
health. The eyesight dims 
with cataracts. The joints 
creek and knees sting going 
up a flight of stairs. Unwill-
ing to appear weak in front 
of grown children, denial 
looms. Anger and frustration 
at anyone who may suggest 

there is a reason to be con-
cerned for safety. Waiting 
until there is an accident or 
medical emergency before 
making any adjustments for 
the limitations that failing 
health or age require in most 
cases is a grave error.
	 One of the biggest rea-
sons given for not getting 
a lifeline or emergency call 
button is cost. Unwilling to 
share that in retirement, 
there are limited funds. The 
cost of living is more than 
most people have expect-
ed. Social Security does not 
cover everything. Shame at 
being so very close to pov-
erty keep many people from 
seeking assistance.
	 Help is available. The Li-
ons Club has been assist-
ing seniors and those with 
limited finances with walk-
ers, wheelchairs and other 
durable medical equipment. 
They also have a program to 
help people get a lifeline, an 
emergency call button, at no 
cost to the recipient. Speak-
ing to one’s doctor, they also 
are aware of other programs 
that could help. When in 
doubt, go to the town se-
lectman or town clerk and 
they can direct you to local 
resources to address your 
needs.
	 Addressing the question, 
do we need to get a lifeline, 
if you are asking the ques-
tion--the answer is yes.

 

A Documentary Film by Bess O’Brien 
 providing an intimate look at the often hidden world  

of prescription drug addiction in Vermont. 

Tuesday, June 20 
7:00 pm 

Wells River Congregational Church Vestry 
76 Main Street N., Wells River 

Includes a discussion led by Bess O’Brien  
immediately after the screening.   

Refreshments will be served. 

 
Co-sponsored by Baldwin Library,  

Wells River Action Program (WRAP),  
 Wells River Congregational Church, 
& the Wells River Prevention Group 

Call the library 802-757-2693 for more info.

Harman’s Cheese & Country Store
1400 Route 117 • Sugar Hill, NH 03586

603-823-8000 • www.HarmansCheese.com

Fine Gourmet Items 
Pure Maple Products • Specialty Cheddars

Really-Aged Cheddar • Aged 2 Full Years
FREE Tasting Samples!

Open 7 Days 

A Week

9:30am  - 5:00pm

Open 7 Days 
A Week

9:30 am - 5:00 pm

Bradford Veterinary Clinic
176 Waits River Rd.

Bradford, VT
Susan Tullar, DVM

DOGS • CATS • EXOTICS • POULTRY

802-222-4903

www.BradfordVet.com • facebook.com/bradfordvetclinic

Call now to schedule your appointment.

Have you thought
about a routine blood work screening

for your pet? A third of seemingly healthy pets
have abnormalities found with blood work.

FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL,FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL,FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL,FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL,FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL,
GET YGET YGET YGET YGET YOUR PET SCREENED FOUR PET SCREENED FOUR PET SCREENED FOUR PET SCREENED FOUR PET SCREENED FOR ONLOR ONLOR ONLOR ONLOR ONLY $35!Y $35!Y $35!Y $35!Y $35!
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By Jim Frohn, 
Grafton County Forester

UNH Extension

	 A walk in the woods - to 
look for guitars?  No, I didn’t 
leave my guitar in the woods 
by mistake on a camping 
trip.  Actually, I was looking 
for trees that are suitable to 
make wood parts for guitars, 
called tonewood.
 	 I recently visited with a 
NH business owner who 
specializes in exactly this. 
He has been involved with 
music, sound, and wood for 
his entire adult life.  He has 
built guitars, owned a com-
pany that made loudspeak-
ers with wood cabinets, 
supplied specialty wood for 
famous rock guitarists’ sig-
nature lines of electric gui-
tars, and has been involved 
in producing tonewood for 
many years.  He described 
tonewood production as be-
ing more akin to gem cutting 
than lumber production.
 	 So what is tonewood?  
It’s the wood used for the 
tops, sides, backs and necks 
of guitars, violins, mando-
lins, and other stringed in-
struments. The producer I 
visited, specializes in tone-
wood for guitars. The top of 
the guitar, the soundboard 
beneath the strings on the 
main body of the instrument, 

is usually made of spruce.  
Various spruce species 
are used, but red spruce, a 
New England native, is de-
scribed as a “holy grail” of 
tonewoods.  The properties 
of red spruce wood produce 
excellent acoustic results. 
There is a lot of science 
behind what makes certain 
woods suitable for musi-
cal instruments, but there 
is a lot of art in recognizing 
and optimizing it.  An expe-
rienced tonewood producer 
can knock on standing trees 
with a hammer or his hand 
and get a sense of whether 
or not they will yield good 
tone wood. 
 	 Not just any red spruce 
is suitable to become a gui-
tar top.  The tree needs to 
be at least 24” in diameter 
at breast height (prefera-
bly 28”), and the minimum 
top diameter of a log is 20”.  
The wood can have no more 
than 8 growth rings per inch, 
with steady, even growth, 
and needs to be free of 
knots, twist, and rot.  In oth-
er words, suitable logs come 
from old, slow growing, but 
healthy trees.  Since most 
forests in New England have 
been logged at least once, 
spruces that are suitable for 
tonewood are very difficult to 
find.  But they are out there.  
Some of the most promis-
ing places are dense stands 
on north facing slopes and 
ravines in difficult to reach 

places.  Trees in these ar-
eas are protected from the 
wind so are more likely to 
grow straight, and are dif-
ficult to access for logging 
so are more likely to grow 
large.  The trees need to be 
grown in dense stands in or-
der to keep their growth slow 
and to reduce branching and 
wind damage.
 	 Because of their rarity, 
spruce trees with these char-
acteristics are very valuable.  
A tonewood spruce log can 
be worth 10 to 20 times the 
value of a spruce destined to 
be made into 2 x 4s or other 
dimensional lumber.  There 
aren’t a lot of these large, 
old, slow growing spruces 
around, so cutting them may 
seem more like mining the 
last of a resource rather than 
stewarding it for the future.  
However, tone wood quali-
ty trees can be purposefully 
grown, as is done in Swit-
zerland and other high-al-
titude European forests.  
The key is to identify them 
early, keep them densely 
spaced, prune the bole, and 
track them over time.  This 
of course is a multi-genera-
tional endeavor, since tone-
wood spruces are harvested 
at 200 to 250 years old. With 
today’s GPS and mapping 
capabilities, it’s much easier 
to keep track of these trees 
than in the past.  Since it’s 
unlikely that a lot of landown-
ers are going to identify and 
grow future tonewood trees, 
there will never be an ex-
cess of these trees available 
and prices will remain high.  
Demand far exceeds sup-
ply, with a long-term trend of 
increasing scarcity.  Those 
that do grow these trees on 
purpose will be providing a 
significant financial benefit 
for future generations and 
can take pride in developing 

a highly valued material to 
be made into a beautiful mu-
sical instrument. 

 Making the tops
	 After the tree is identi-
fied and felled, the suitable 
logs are brought to the shop 
where they are cross cut 
into 24” long sections called 
bucks, then further split by 
hand into pie-shaped billets 
varying in number between 
four and eight per buck, with 
a tool called a froe.  This tool 
is essentially a blade and a 
wood handle perpendicular 
to each other, which was 
historically used for splitting 
shingles and riving boards. 
The wood is split instead of 
sawn in order to closely fol-
low the grain and preserve its 
integrity.  Each billet is then 
sawn on a band saw into 
individual guitar top halves, 
with the grain of each piece 
oriented exactly perpendic-
ular to its surface. The pro-
cess of producing the tops 
requires much careful han-
dling and attention to de-
tail, gained through experi-
ence.  They are air dried and 
stored between flat boards 
in stacks; these are called 
stock books.  The wood from 
each tree is carefully tracked 
by its position in each log, 
so if a luthier (guitar mak-
er) likes a particular set of 
tops, then the supplier can 

provide them with another 
pair from the same section 
of log.  It takes two pieces to 
make a top, so they are sold 
in bookmatched pairs. (Pic-
ture butterflying a steak- a 
section is cut in half length-
wise, then the adjacent piec-
es are opened like a book, 
so the grain matches up.)
 	 After learning more about 
tonewood, I wanted to see 
if I could find some suitable 
trees.  I remembered a par-
ticular stand of large spruce 
where I once worked in 
Maine.  There was a steep 
ravine and a lot of rocks, dif-
ficult to reach with logging 
machinery.  When visiting 
the state in early March, I 
went out to see if I could lo-
cate these trees.  I was able 
to find them, but as is true 
with many things, they were 
a little bit smaller than they 
were in my mind’s eye.  But 
they were of decent size, so 
they may have potential for 
the future.  The largest one 
I found had a 23” diameter, 
and it appeared to be clear 
of knots, but it’s hard to tell.  
The growth rings are prob-
ably narrow, given the poor 
soils in the area.  So who 
knows, maybe a few years 
down the road the wood will 
end up in someone’s guitar, 
and the legacy of the tree 
will live on in the music.

A Walk in the Woods – Looking for Guitars

Congratulations go out to 
Megan Smith 

For winning our June drawing for a 
$50.00 Gift Certificate at 

 

Trendy Threads 
171 Central St 

Woodsville, NH  603-747-3870 
 

(our next $50.00 gift certificate drawing will be July 2017, 
come in and sign up, no purchase necessary.) 

www.TrendyThreadsWoodsville.com 
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GARY SIEMONS, PROPRIETOR
603-747-4192

95 Central Street, Woodsville, NH
Hours: M-F 8-5

Full Service Auto Repair
Foreign & Domestic

Alignments • Brakes • Lube, Oil & Filter Changes
Oil Undercoating • State Inspections • Tires

Towing & Recovery • Tune-Ups • Used Car Sales

GRS Tire & Auto
It's Hatchland Farm's Open Barn 

on Saturday, June 24th., 2017.
Listen to WYKR-101.3FM for details !!!

	 My sun worshiping days 
are over, as a teenager I be-
lieved that bathing in it was 
a great idea and did so of-
ten. The ozone layer today 
is much more dangerous 
and doctors and other health 
professionals are very clear 
on the dangers of too much 
exposure. Every group is 
stressing the importance of 
using sunscreen protection 
on a daily basis, however 
the mass produced market-
ed products contain carcino-
gens.  I heard on the radio 
last week that there is now a 
sunscreen pill and the mar-
keting group was calling out 
for those wishing for a free 
trial, for me that is asking to 
put cancer directly into one’s 
body. In my shoppe many 
ask what I use to keep my 
healthy complexion and for 
sunscreen. As always I only 
use nature, healthy skin ob-
viously comes from inside 
out, I live on Super greens, 
for sun blocking properties 
many natural oils contain 
SPF (Sun Protection Factor) 
qualities. I choose oils that I 
would eat, alone or with oth-
er ingredients. 
	 I have written before on 
the incredible benefits of 
Sea buckthorn berries, this 
infused oil has a SPF of up to 
50%; Sesame seed oil has a 
SPF of up to 30%, Apricot oil 
has a SPF of up to 30% and 
contains vitamin B17, which 
is widely known for its cancer 
preventative qualities. Other 
oils that have a SPF of up to 
20% are Olive, Coconut and 

Peanut. Avocado oil is ex-
cellent for moisturizing the 
skin and hair because it has 
very high vitamin A & E con-
tents and absorbs ultraviolet 
radiation from the sun. One 
does not need to protect the 
skin with expensive lotions, 
providing you keep Organi-
cally pure oils in your kitch-
en, you are ready for the 20 
minutes of sun required dai-
ly to absorb vitamin D. Be-
sides being linked to skin 
cancer, overexposure to the 
sun also breaks down colla-
gen, the protein substance 
that gives the skin elastic-
ity, making wrinkles and 
lines more apparent. This 
is why people who spend a 
great deal of time outdoors 
in direct sunlight have drier, 
tougher-looking skin.  
	 You can still be active 
outdoors and enjoy the sun, 
but use common sense and 
the following guidelines to 
protect your skin:
	 • Always use sun pro-
tection. PABA, also known 
as para-aminobenzoic acid, 
this water-soluble B vitamin, 
when applied topically and 
combined with other sun 
protectors such as jojoba oil 
and Shea Butter, offers ex-
cellent UVA-UVB protection.  
PABA can be purchased 
in a liquid form at many of 
the better pharmacies and 
health food stores.
	 • Avoid being out in direct 
sunlight during the middle of 
the day. This is usually from 
about 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 
p.m. You can still tan (and 

burn) before ten and after 
three, so “cover yourself.”
	 • Always wear sunglass-
es. Sunglasses are the best 
beauty tool for slowing down 
wrinkling around the eyes 
and they help to protect the 
eyes from harmful rays.
	 • Cover your hair with a 
hat or a scarf if out in direct 
sunlight for a long period of 
time, as the sun can be very 
drying. This is especially im-
portant if you dye your hair, 
as the sun can also lighten 
the color. You can spread a 
small amount of your favor-
ite SPF oil on your hair for 
protection.
	 Below are some of the 
qualities of my common 
choices:
	 Green Tea: The potent 
phytochemicals in green 
tea, especially its catechins, 
have been shown to be 
highly effective protectors 
against skin cancer. Green 
tea works both when con-
sumed as a beverage and 
applied topically.
	 Milk Thistle Seeds: Si-
lymarin, the active com-
pound in Milk Thistle , is a 
significant protector against 
sun-related cancers.
	 Sea buckthorn berry oil: 
Anti-aging: Rich in vitamin 
A and vitamin E, sea buck-
thorn can help reduce the 

appearance of wrinkles and 
retard premature skin matu-
ration.
	 Skin diseases: Sever-
al studies have investigat-
ed sea buckthorn’s ability 
to treat conditions such as 
acne, dermatitis, eczema, 
skin lesions and rosacea. 
Its skin-healing abilities are 
due to its high essential fatty 
acid, flavonoids, protein and 
vitamin content.
	 Sun Block: Sea buck-
thorn naturally absorbs the 
sun’s harmful UV rays which 
can cause skin damage and 
may lead to skin cancer, 
SPF up to 50%.
	 Wound and burn healing 
skin rejuvenation: Palmitole-
ic acid, which is just one of 
the fatty acids produced by 
sea buckthorn, is a naturally 
occurring substance in the 
skin. Thus, sea buckthorn 
has proved very effective 
in the treatment of wounds, 
burns dermatitis and even 
cancers of the skin.
	 Sesame Seed Oil: A pale 
yellow oil made from ses-
ame seeds; it has a mild 
sesame scent. It has sun 
screening properties, one of 
the highest for natural oils, 
up to 30% SPF. This oil can 
be found in the cooking oil 
section of the better grocery 
stores.
	 Shea Butter: Also known 
as Karite butter, studies 
show that this moisturizer is 

able to block ultraviolet ra-
diation alone or when com-
bined with PABA.
	 Apricot Kernel Oil:  A light 
oil obtained from the kernels 
or pits of apricots, it is a pop-
ular body oil as it does not 
leave an oily film on the skin, 
SPF up to 30%, vitamin B17. 
This can be harder to find, it 
is available in some food co-
ops and online.
	 Coconut Oil: A solid white 
oil at room temperature. It 
preserves the skin and hair 
by providing a protective 
layer that locks in natural 
moisture. You can use it as 
a conditioner for your hair, 
skin, and lips.
	 Jojoba Bean Oil: The jo-
joba plant is found in South-
ern Arizona, Southern Cali-
fornia, and Northern Mexico. 
On the jojoba shrub grows 
a pod that contains one to 
three seeds, 48 to 51% of 
which is oil. Jojoba bean oil 
has become very popular re-
cently because it is very sim-
ilar to our bodies’ own natu-
ral oils. Native Americans 
and Mexicans have used 
jojoba beans for centuries.
	 Melanie Osborne is the 
owner of Thyme to Heal herb-
als and has a private practice 
on Route 302 in Lisbon, NH. 
She has been in practice since 
1991. She is certified in Ther-
apeutic Herbalism through the 
Blazing Star Herbal School, in 
Shelburne Falls, MA. 

Natural Sun Protection
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Step by Step School of Dance/Live a Little Fitness 
1st Annual Dance Recital  

Saturday, June 17th at 6pm 
Days Inn in N. Lincoln, NH. 

“Open to the public.” 
Come support our local talent and 
enjoy some amazing performances! 

Tickets are $7.50 (under 10) and $10 (10 years and up.) 
Call 603-991-3387 for more details or to purchase tickets.

STEP BY STEP SCHOOL OF DANCE SUMMER 
DANCE CAMP CLASSES AT LIVE A LITTLE FITNESS 
Every Tuesday & Wednesday beginning July 11th & 12th 

(6 week program.)  *603-991-3387*
TUESDAYS: 3:45-4:45pm: mixed styles/acro w/mats (ages 5-8)

6:15-7:15pm:  mixed styles/acro mats (ages 9-14)
7:30-8:30:  mixed styles (teen/adult.)  
WEDNESDAYS: 11:45am-12:30pm: 

toddler dance/mats (ages 2-41/2)
6:30-7:30pm: *NEW* Country Line (teen/adult.) 

Come join us for some great summer learning and FUN!

  

GRAFTON COUNTY DAYS 
June 17 & 18, 2017 

Departure Times: 1pm & 3pm 

DISCOUNTED TICKETS FOR GRAFTON COUNTY 
RESIDENTS WITH PROOF OF RESIDENCY 

 

Tickets: $17 adults / $13 kids 3-11 (ages 2 and under free!) 

64 Railroad Street, Lincoln, NH         (603) 745-2135 

With Offices in
St. Johnsbury 802-748-2045

Danville 802-684-1127

www.beginrealty.com

BARNET:  This 
charming cape has 
vinyl siding, a metal 
roof and replacement 
windows and a full 
dry basement.  Easy 
maintenance! There 
are three bedrooms 
and a full bath.  A 
one-car garage and lots of storage are a great plus 
but the real bonus is the fully fenced, open yard. 
$110,000 -- ML4636708

 Ethan Eames of Littleton 
served as a page last week at 
the NH House of Representa-
tives in Concord. His day in-
cluded meeting the Speaker of 
the House, Shawn Jasper, and 
Secretary of State Bill Gard-
ner. The Sergeant-At-Arms kept 
Ethan busy running up and 
down the stairs from the House 
Chamber to the House Clerk’s 
office delivering copies of votes 
cast by members.  He partici-
pated in the annual “Hot Dog” 
Day cookout on the grounds of 
the State House, as well as the 
Speaker’s Ice Cream Social.  
Ethan’s parents are Jack and 
Victoria Eames and he will be 
entering his junior year at St 
Johnsbury Academy in the fall.  
Ethan is pictured with Rep. 
Brad Bailey, Rep. Erin Hen-
nessey and Rep. Linda Massi-
milla.

DAVIS REALTY OF NH & VT, INC.
139 Central St. - Woodsville, NH * 603-747-3211 • Fax 603-747-3575

Email: Davis Realty1958@gmail.com • Web: www.davisrealtynhvt.com
NORTH HAVERHILL, NH - Sprawl-
ing 1886 sq. ft. Ranch with 3 bed-
rooms and 2½ bathrooms, situated 
on 1.7 Acres. Huge Living Room, 
modern Kitchen fully applianced, 
hardwood floors, large enclosed 
porch. Lower level offers the oppor-
tunity for expansion. 2 car attached 
garage.  Great Buy!   $119,500.

NORTH HAVERHILL, NH - 
Charming Cape with 1800 sq. ft. 
in Haverhill corners features 3+ 
Bedrooms, large farmer kitchen, 
dining room, porch, above ground 
pool, woodstove capable of whole 
house heating, includes a lovely 
32 x 36 barn with huge loft, room 
for a shop and garage.  $129,500.  

LANDAFF, NH - Exceptional 
Ranch with 2400 sq. ft. of living 
area. Private country setting.   
Features include 3 bedrooms, 
2¾ bathrooms, wonderful in-law 
apartment or guest area, Kitchen 
with newer stainless steel appli-
ances, whirlpool tub, central vac-
uum, ceiling fans, whole house 
generator, 10 x 20 shed, 2 car 
attached garage. Many more fea-
tures. $229,500

HAVERHILL, NH -  Easily walk to 
the lakes with beaches this sum-
mer. Adorable well maintained cha-
let is for vacation fun or year round 
living. Douglas fir beams, 2 Bed-
rooms with skylights, pellet stove, 
large private rear deck. Several re-
cent upgrades to the home. Owner 
is licensed real estate broker. New 
roof to be installed and new washer 
and dryer.  $116,500.
IF YOU ARE THINKING OF SELLING.    LET’S MEET

We can provide a price opinion.

YOUR AD 
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BE HERE
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per issue
in full color
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